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PRE-KINDERGARTEN
BRIANNA SELBY  AND

MRS. HUGHES

Dear Santa,
My name is Jude and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a yellow dirt bike, an 
Elsa bike, a little trampoline, and 
a high flyer.

JUDE T. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Rhoan and I am 

10 years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
please bring me some PJ Masks, 
hairbrush, a car...actually 10 cars, 
and a prize.

RHOAN S. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Troy and I am 5 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a mario castle.

TROY M. AGE 5

Dear Santa,
My name is Ayden and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a race track, a dinosaur 
with a mouth, and a bell.

AYDEN A. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Jeremiah and I am 

4 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a big ‘ole T-Rex, a cage, 
a truck-like a dinosaur truck, and 
a Dino-Tractor.

JEREMIAH P. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Atlas and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good and not so good at 
times. For Christmas please bring 
me a crane, a cup, and a hogging 
truck. Oh, and a fork lift.

ATLAS W. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Jardani and I am 

4 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a bus, a jetpack, and a 
robot.

JARDANI T. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is George and I am 

4 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a ninja turtle statue and 
I want his name to be Leonardo. 
A carpi sun and a fan.

GEORGE H. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Cora and I am 5 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a pink bike, a donut 
shop, makeup, and a pizza shop.

CORA H. AGE 5

Dear Santa,
My name is Jonathon and I am 

5 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a JJ school bus for my 
sissy and me, a robot, and a toy 
computer.

JONATHON M. AGE 5

Dear Santa,
My name is Corey and I am 5 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a robot and a race car 
track.

COREY H. AGE 5

Dear Santa,
My name is Wyatt and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me magnetic cars, legos, 
and some race cars. And two 
special race cars for me and sissy.

WYATT H. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Arabella and I am 

5 years old. This year I have been 
very good and not so good at 
times. For Christmas please bring 
me a foot massager, Megan doll, a 
toy family that can move and talk 
and a coloring book.

ARABELLA R. AGE 5

Dear Santa,
My name is Liza and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good and not so good at 
times. For Christmas please bring 
me kinetic sand, a Elsa payset, a 
new water bottle and lunchbox, 
and a glow in the dark sparkly 
Cindy Lou Who toy, and shopkins.

LIZA S. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Storm and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good and not so good at 
times. For Christmas please bring 
me a crying baby, a snow globe, 
sparkly backpack, some stamps, 
and that’s all.

STORM T. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Paislee and I am 4 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a big kitchen with a toy 
phone.

PAISLEE M. AGE 4

Dear Santa,
My name is Kolton and I am 5 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me a toy motorcycle, bat-
man, and nothing else.

KOLTON M. AGE 5

Dear Santa,
My name is Emmett and I am 

4 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas please 
bring me transformers, a truck 
with a target, star wars, batman, 
and oh yeah superman.

EMMETT B. AGE 4

JACKIE HOWARD’S CLASS
KINDERGARTEN

Dear Santa,
I would like an alive doll and 

a puppy. I would also like a uni-
corn.	 That is all I want for 
Christmas.

Love,
MYA COMBS

Dear Santa,
Please get me a cry baby, 

baby bottle with milk, and a paci-
fier for the baby.

Love,
HUNTER MILLER

Dear Santa,
Please Santa, will you bring 

me a unicorn and a stuffie and 
mermaid and LOL doll for Christ-
mas.

Love, Addison
Dear Santa,
Will you please get me a big 

doll for Christmas? I would also 
like a coloring book and a big LOL 
doll. Thank you! Love,

REMINGTON HURA
 
Dear Santa,
Please bring me a new car, so 

I don’t have to drive my jeep and 
give me a new kitchen, so I can 
play all by myself. Thank you!

LOVE, JAMES HOLT

Dear Santa,
Can you please get me a new 

tablet and can you get my mom 
to feel better? I would also like to 
have a safe.

Love,
JACKSON ADAMS

Dear Santa,
Please get me a tablet and 

Barbie and a Barbie doll house 
and a pink heart.

Love,
FREYA OWENS-ALLEN

Dear Santa,
Will you please bring me a 

slinky and a mermaid tail and a 
car and a cry baby and a little 
slinky?

Love,
BRINLEY TERRELL

 

Dear Santa,
I would like a bicycle. I would 

like a new jeep and a pet turtle. I 
would like a fake keyboard and a 
fake kitchen set. Love,

HASTON GULLA

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I would like 

a robot and a new Roadblocks 
game.

LOVE, JAMESON LEE

BONDECROFT ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN

AUDREY WELCH’S CLASS

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want a 

little doll. The elf is named chippy. 
I want a phone and a ninja kid. I 
want a book about Christmas and 
toy cows and a necklace.

LOVE, ISABELLA S.

Dear Santa,
I have been nice. I want a red 

elf. I want a horse. I want a little 
cat.

LOVE, RILEY S.

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want a new 

elf. I want a piggy stuffed animal!
LOVE, KELLY H.

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want a 

phone and a tablet. I want an Elf.
LOVE, ARMANI T.

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want a 

phone. I want a dog toy. I want a 
Beach ball!

LOVE, TRISTIN D.

Dear Santa,
I have been nice. I want a real 

cat. I want a shirt that says “Wy-
att is the best!” I want a desk. I 
want new shoes.

LOVE, JOSIE Q.

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want four 

spinosaurus and one triceratops. 
I want five T-Rexes. I want the 
book Elf on the Shelf.

LOVE, GRAYSON F.

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want a 

phone. I want a ball and a tree-
house. I want a koala. I want a 
crab. I want a little car.

LOVE AESIR J.

Dear Santa,
I really want a green screen. I 

really want a tablet and phone. I 
want a piano and a guitar. I want 
a RC car and electric scooter with 
big wheels. I want any car you 
can bring me.

THANK YOU, KYSIN BRUMAGIN

BONDECROFT ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE
JESSICA DAY

Dear Santa,
How do you get to the North 

Pole? For Christmas, can I please 
have a cat, a yellow pool, and a 
big donut? This year, I have been 
good.

LOVE, EMMA BRADY

Dear Santa
How are you feeling for christ-

mas Can Please have Paint Paper 
and glue is year I have been good.

LOVE AVA MATHENEY

Dear Santa,
What do you do at the North 

Pole? For Christmas, can I please 
have a Stitch toy, squashmols, 
and purple fajita? This year, I have 
been super good.

LOVE, EMERY BECKER

Dear Santa,
Do you get sick when you eat 

all the cookies? For Christmas, 
can I please have rollerskates, toy 
mermaid, and a toy horse? This 
year, I have been good, nice, help-
ful, and had good behavior.

LOVE, TIMBER CAMPBELL

Dear Santa,
When you came can you tell 

Elfie that I love her? For Christ-
mas can I please have a Bluey, 
and a Bluey car, and a Bluey 
house? 

LOVE, AUBREE RUTLEDGE

Dear Santa, 
How did the elf get here to our 

classroom? For Christmas, can I 

please have a submarine, a robot, 
and a choo-choo train, and a 
helicopter? This year, I have been 
very good except for on the bus. 
But, I will sit down and behave. 

LOVE, WILKIN CLARK

Dear Santa, 
How do you make all these 

gifts? For Christmas, can I please 
have a TV, a dog, and a watch? 
This year I have been a bit naugh-
ty, but mostly kind.

LOVE,  LINCOLN LOVARIO

Dear Santa,
Do you like the North Pole? 

For Christmas, can I please have 
a cat dog and a pretty purple 
and a orange and blue and pink 
dress? I have been good and a 
little naughty.

LOVE, HARPER SCOTT

Dear Santa,
Where do the reindeer sleep? 

For Christmas, can I please have 
a cute unicorn plushie, a flower 
crown, and a Arctic Puffin plush-
ie? This year, I have been on my 
best behavior. 

LOVE, ELLA EDMONDS

Dear Santa,
How are you doing at the 

North Pole? For Christmis, can I 
please have a American Girl Doll, 
diary, and a fancy cup. This year 
I have been on my best behavior 
and hard warking.

LOVE, EMMY JO JUSTICE GRIFFIN

Dear Santa,
How do you get to the North 

Pole? For Christmas, can I please 
have a blue dragon, a red dragon, 
and paint? This year I have been 
good.

Love, Christopher Norris

Dear Santa,
How do you get to the North 

Pole? For Christmas, can I please 
have a X-Box, headphones, and a 
Nintendo Switch? This year, I have 
been good.

LOVE, EMMETT WHITE

Dear Santa,
Is it cold at the North Pole? 

For Christmas, can I please have 
a baby doll please and clothes 
please. Then can you get me a 
dress? This year I have been good 
and a bit naughty.

LOVE, ANNISTON CONOVER

Dear Santa,
How do you get Elfie for 

christmas can I please have nun-
chucks cars cars and a robot this 
year I have been naughty and 
nice. Sorry.

LOVE,  CADEN LEE BRYANT

BONDECROFT ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

RACHEL HOLMAN

Dear Santa,
Do you like the North Pole? 

For Christmas, I would like a Nin-
tendo and an RC car.

LOVE, SAMUEL VOGT

Dear Santa,
Where is the North Pole? For 

Christmas, I would like a Nerf gun 
and some Legos. Santa, I’ve been 
an okay boy, but I’m doing better.

LOVE, RANDAL SALAS-GOMEZ

Dear Santa,
What do reindeers eat? For 

Christmas, I would like a Squish-
mallow, a bean bag, a quilt, and 
an electric scooter. I have been 
an okay girl.

LOVE, LILITH OWENS-ALLEN

Dear Santa,
When will you come to my 

house? For Christmas, I would 
like a 3-d pen. Santa, I have been 
good.

LOVE, EMMA LAMB

Dear Santa,
What is the North Pole like? 

For Christmas, I would like a ro-
bot, Drone, and a drone truck. I 
am trying to be better.

LOVE, MILO HAFNER

Dear Santa,
How are your elves doing? 

For Christmas, I would like Stitch 
toys, art stuff, and Stitch clothes. 
Santa, I have been good.

LOVE, AUTUMN SHOCKLEY

Dear Santa,
Where do you live at? For 

Christmas, I would like make-up, 

5500 Roberts Matthews Hwy5500 Roberts Matthews Hwy
Sparta, TN • 931-738-8376Sparta, TN • 931-738-8376

www.precision-molding.comwww.precision-molding.com

Merry ChristmasMerry Christmas
We hope your Christmas season is filled 
with friendship, love, laughter, warmth, 

and many surprises.

566 N. Spring St., Sparta, TN | 931.836.2259 Firm# 1774 | 
TriStar-Sparta.com
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an elf, a Stitch and a puppy. I’ve 
been good.

LOVE, RHYLYNN FARLEY

Dear Santa,
How are you doing today? 

For Christmas, I would like a dog 
Squishmallow, snocone machine, 
and a puppy pillow. Santa, I have 
been good.

LOVE, VIVIAN

Dear Santa,
What is your reindeer’s name? 

For Christmas, I would like a Cry 
baby, a cookie freezer, anda Grin-
ch doll. Santa, I have been good.

LOVE, JAYCIE CHAMBERS

Dear Santa,
How is the North Pole? For 

Christmas, I would like a ps5 and 
an Aranado jersey. Santa, I am 
trying to be good.

LOVE, IVAN CARCACHE

Dear Santa,
How is it going at the North 

Pole? I hope you are happy! For 
Christmas, I would like a Renaldo 
jersey, a Charzaaar stuffy, a Mr. 
Beast basketball, and a x-shot 
sniper play toy.

LOVE, LUKAS GODSEY

Dear Santa,
What is the North Pole like? 

How do you get there? For 
Christmas, I would like a Stitch 
and an Ariel doll. Santa, I have 
been good.

LOVE, AMYA LAPOINT

Dear Santa,
What does it look like at 

the North Pole? For Christmas, 
I would like a dog, toys, and 
clothes. I have been good.

LOVE, BRAXTON BRYANT

Dear Santa,
How are your reindeer? For 

Christmas, I would like a toy 
drone, and a toy truck. Santa, I 
have been very good.

LOVE, DUSTIN HOLLAND

CASSVILLE ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN

AMANDA STOCKSON

Dear Santa, 
For Christmas I would like a 

toy pick ax.
FROM WAYLON BLAYLOCK

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like an 

electric house.
FROM MACEY BROWN

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

unicorn.
FROM TEAGAN BRUSAW

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like an 

Elf on the Shelf.
FROM OAKLEY HALLIBURTON

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

walking doll.
FROM SKYLAR HOLLOWAY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

remote control car.
FROM JAXON HOLMAN

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

tiny kitty robot.
FROM ELENA JONES

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

water gun.
FROM KAYSEN LAMON

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

gun that shoots fireworks.
FROM RIVER MADDUX

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

puppy dog.
FROM NAEVIA MARSH

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

Batman car.
FROM HUNTER MATHERLY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

skateboard.
FROM BRIDGER MORGAN

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like 

some Play-Doh.
FROM LORETTA OPERLE

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

dollhouse.
FROM KENNEDY STRAUSBAUGH

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

piano.
FROM BONNIE WEBSTER

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would a new 

bat.
FROM ABRAM WHITE

CASSVILLE ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN

DEBORAH MCBRIDE

Dear Santa, 
For Christmas I would like a 

big Littlest Pet Shop.
FROM KAYDE’ANNA BILBREY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

remote control race car.
FROM MAVERICK BRADY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

bunch of sparkly rings.
FROM RORY DEBORD

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

toy phone.
FROM GIDEON HOOD

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

new tablet.
FROM LINCOLN HOWELL

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like new 

sparkly shoes.
FROM AURELIA KELLY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like 

Sonic toys.
FROM ZY’MIR KING

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like lots 

of Barbie stuff.
FROM MCKENNA LAWSON

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like LOL 

dolls. 
FROM BAILEY MATHERLY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

police car.
FROM AUDREY MORRIS

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

cat.
FROM BAILEY RANDOLPH

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

race track.
FROM RENESAMAE REYES

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

bunch of dinosaurs.
FROM THOMAS STEELMAN

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like Lit-

tlest Pet Shop. 
FROM BRYNLEIGH STOUT

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

baby doll.
FROM CORA SULLIVAN

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like Ju-

rassic Park.
FROM JAMESON TATROW

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

big butterfly toy.
FROM PAISLEE THOMPSON

CASSVILLE
FIRST GRADE

CHARLENE BLAYLOCK

Dear Santa,
I want cats and a rocket boost-

er for my dirt bike. I have been 
nice. 

RYDEN NEWTON

Dear Santa,
You are the best Santa ever. 

I can’t wait for you to visit me. 
Sincerely,

SIDNEY NICHOLSON

Dear Santa,
Hello, I would please like to 

have a Monster High Doll, a clock, 

a plant and a pot, a big panda and 
a lot of rainbow unicorn plushies. 
Thank you.

DAYLEE WATTS

Dear Santa,
 I wish for family and friends to 

have a great Christmas. I hope for 
the 32 Lego Men. I hope that I get 
a dirt bike for my brother and lots 
of love for my mom. 

LOVE, EZRA BROWN

Dear Santa,
I want a purse for Christmas 

and a Stanley. Another thing I 
want is UGGs and makeup and a 
mini fridge and teacher stuff and 
a lot of other stuff for Christmas. 

SINCERELY, MALLORI CLOUSE

Dear Santa,
I hope you are doing well. I am 

sorry for being bad. I hope you 
can forgive me. I really try to be 
good. I would really like a new 
bike, nintendo switch and new 
baseball gear. Please bring my 
sister, brother, and cousin Karo-
line toys also. I will leave you and 
the reindeer some treats.

SINCERELY, MASON D. HODGE

Dear Santa,
I want mini brands, Gabby’s 

dollhouse, Rainbow High, Camera 
3 Berenstain Bears books, Polly 
pockets and Hello Kitty Comic 
Book.

 SINCERELY, KLOE HALE

Dear Santa,
What I want for Christmas is a 

helicopter and a plane. 
MASON HOLMAN

Dear Santa,
I have been very good this 

year. For Christmas, I want an 
LED writing board, Nerf gun, Hot 
Wheels, and a glow frisbee. I will 
help my mom make some cookies 
for you. 

LOVE, STEVIE MORRIS

Dear Santa,
Merry Christmas! I would like a 

stuffed animal that is as big as my 
dog Moose, some monster trucks 
for my little brother. Also, some 
make-up and stuff for teachers 
at my school. A Squishmallow 
would be wonderful too and a 
case for my tablet. P.S. I have 
been nice!  

SINCERELY, AMIAH BARNES

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a Jurassic 

Park Lego set and a Cyber toy 
set. I have been nice this year. 

LOVE, KNOX HICKS

Dear Santa,
All I want for Christmas is 

a chair and new clothes and a 
SpongeBob toy and stuffy. I have 
been nice this year. 

LOVE, KALI GRANTHAM

Dear Santa,
I would like some slime and 

kinetic sand, Furby, Nintendo 
Switch, games and a 4 wheeler 
and a robot. I want another robot 
and slime kit as well. I havebeen 
nice this year.  

SINCERELY, WHITLEY PHILLIPS

Dear Santa,
My name is Kade Oakley 

Hodge. I have tried to be good 
this year but sometimes I am not. 
I will try harder next year.  I want 
a dinosaur robot, remote control 
excavator, blocks, and play-doh. 
Please bring my Sissy and Bubba 
something for Christmas and my 
baby cousin Karoline some toys. 
I will leave you some milk and 
cookies.  

LOVE, KADE OAKLEY HODGE

Dear Santa,
My name is Karoline Blake Usie. 

I have been really good.  I am al-
most 6 months old. I saw you the 
other night and you didn’t scare 
me one little bit. I thought you 
were funny. I really don’t know 
much about you or this Christmas 
stuff. For Christmas, I want some 
teeth, so my gums will quit hurt-
ing.  I want some more bibs to 
catch all this drool coming from 
my mouth, some more yummy 
baby food(that stuff is amazing!) 
I want some new teether toys 
and anything that I can chew 
on. Bring my mommy and daddy 
some good stuff. Don’t forget to 
bring my cousins, aunties, and 
Grandmas and Papas something 
too. I probably won’t leave you 
anything this year, because I 
don’t do cookies yet.

LOVE, KAROLINE BLAKE USIE

CASSVILLE ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

MARY GRAHAM

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
all the time. What I would like 
most this Christmas is a PS5 and 
a 4-wheeler. And I promise to 
leave out cookies and milk for 
you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, KEEGAN HILL

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
all the time. What I would like 
most this Christmas is a stuffie 
and a Barbie. And I promise to 
leave out cookies and milk for 
you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, GRACE FLETCHER

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
some of the time. What I would 
like most this Christmas is a 
Christmas tree and an elf. And I 
promise to leave out cookies for 
you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, WREN GUNTER

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
all the time. What I would like 
most this Christmas is an electric 
scooter and Legos. And I promise 
to leave out cookies and milk for 
you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, ALAN FLATT

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
all the time. What I would like 
most this Christmas is a scooter 
and a bike. And I promise to leave 
out cookies for you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, EVELYN MOORE

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 6 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
some of the time. What I would 
like most this Christmas is some 
Legos and Bakugans. And I prom-
ise to leave out cookies for you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, CHARLES PAUL

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 6 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
some of the time. What I would 
like most this Christmas is a baby 
stroller and a baby dog. And I 
promise to leave out some cook-
ies for you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, STELLA GOOCH

Dear Santa,
My Christmas List
I would like:
*To see my dad
*To see my NeeNee
*A fox (so bad!)
*A kitty
*A duck
*To have a good day
*To see my other Nana
*To go to Hawaii

LOVE, LAVINIA GONZALES 

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 6 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
some of the time. What I would 
like most this Christmas is a 
stuffed animal reindeer and coins. 
And I promise to leave out cook-
ies and milk for you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, LILLY PERDEW

Dear Santa,
My Christmas List
I want a 4-wheeler.
I want a dirt bike.
I want a crossbow.
I want a race car.
I want an RC car.
I want a go-kart.
I want a TV.
I want a phone.

LOVE, TUCKER HURT

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
some of the time. What I would 
like most this Christmas is gold 
and Rudolph. And I promise to 
leave out carrots for you!

CONTINUED ON 4A
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Merry Christmas, Santa!

LOVE, PRESTON WELLS

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 6 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
all the time. What I would like 
most this Christmas is a fake baby 
and a scooter. And I promise to 
leave out cookies and milk for 
you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, BELLA CRIPPS

Dear Santa,
My Christmas List
I would like:
*Slime
*A new blanket
*A new plushie
*a VR
*Money
*A game
*New shoes (size 2)

LOVE, LANDON SMITH

Dear Santa, 
My Christmas List
I would like:
*A hoverboard
*To go to Disney
*Squishie
*A house for me to meet Santa
*A mini kit
*And to spend time with my 

family
LOVE, CHARLOTTE HUDDLESTON

Dear Santa,
My Christmas List
I would like:
*Blue ducks
*Pickle gummies
*A teddy bear
*A big chocolate
*2 boxes of candy canes

LOVE, CASH OAKES

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
all the time. What I would like 
most this Christmas is a ring and a 
baby doll. And I promise to leave 
out cookies and milk for you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, AUDRIE LAFEVER

Dear Santa,
This Christmas, I am 7 years 

old. This year, I have been good 
some of the time. What I would 
like most this Christmas is a 
phone and a Nintendo Switch. 
And I promise to leave out trou-
ble for you!

Merry Christmas, Santa!
LOVE, CARSON FARRIS

CASSVILLE ELEMENTARY
SECOND GRADE

NIKKI KERR

Dear Santa,
I have been a good girl. I am 

sorry for my bruthers be havyer. 
For Christmas, I want a puppy, 
I want a new Nave because her 
ilashis are coming out.  I want to 
tuch our elves. I wish for a new 
playground. I want rane deer elf 
pets.

LOVE, REMI-KATE SEIBERS

Dear Santa,
Wate do you feed yor ran-

deer to make them fliy? I have 
been nice to my friends I have 
done all of the thangs I could to 
be on the nice ist. I have been 
in my good form. I really want a 
makeup stand. How do you make 
your slay go? How do you get the 
elfs to fly?

LOVE, MAKENNA BLAYLOCK

Dear Santa,
Have I been a good girl or a 

bad girl this year?  Can I have a 
stuff animal dog and reindeer 
from elve on the shelf? Can I 
have a camera for Christmas? 
How many elves do you have at 
your work shop? Can I have a real 
hamster for Christmas? What is 
your faverite drink and cookie?

I love you!
KINSLEE HODGE

Dear Santa Claus,
I wish you will have a good 

day. Tell one of your elfs to come 
to my house.

Please pick a hard working 
elf. I think that I have been good. 
Please tell my perens I have been 
hardworking today. Can you tell 
Roodof I love him. Can me and 
him go on a date?

I love you!
ELYSE FARLEY

Dear Santa Claus,
Do you like Dog Man? I have 

been really good this year. Will 
my sister get her elf this year? For 
Christmas, can I get Super Pow-
ers, robot parts, and a thawsan 
dollars. Also, can I get a trip 
to Disnyland with my family, my 
friend Riah, and my teacher Mrs. 
Nikki. Also whens my elf coming? 
One year can I get a pet tiger and 
a pet dinosor?
LOVE, KOLT STRAUSBAUGH

Dear Santa,
I have been good this year. 

My friend Kinsee and Mrs. Nikki 
need a present. I need one too. I 
want a nail kit and two baby dolls, 
baby doll cloths, babydoll pj’s and 
shoes. I allso want a cheer alfit 
with cheer shoes, cheer clothes 
and cheer bow, and cheer pom 
poms. Oh also a four wheeler.

I love you Santa,
NOVALEE BILLINGS

Dear Santa,
Could I have a alectrik four wil-

er? I want my family to be happy. 
Could I have a hotwil set? Could I 
have a set of earpods?

LOVE, OAKLEY GRANTHAM

Dear Santa,
 Hi Santa!  How are you this 

year? I have been so good this 
year. I have been so good to Mrs. 
Nikki. She has been so good to 
me. I want for Christmas a dirt 
bike and my four wheeler parts, a 
shotgun and a realistic Nerf gun.

I love you Santa,
CARTER SUTTON

Dear Santa,
I have ben good. Can I have a 

dog? Can I have a big stufe? Can 
I have a bag of popcorn?

I love you,
LILLIANA WILEY

Dear Santa,
I want a xbox and send it 

to (inserted address here LOL) 
please. Also I want a 1000 dolors. 
I want a chicken stuffy for my 
sister please. The last one is sand, 
I need two bags please.

Thanks,
COOPER CARD

Dear Santa,
I want for Christmas is every-

body to be happy and I get no 
toys. Who is your favorit rein-
deer? What is your favorit milk 
and cookie? How many hours 
does it take to deliver presents?

Merry Christmas Santa.
LIAM OPERLE

Dear Santa,
 I want a Barbie doll dream-

house dream. I want to have a 
baby doll too. For Christmas I 
want a swing, some skate shoes 
that turn into skates on your 
shoes. For Christmas I would like 
a Stitch animal that is a stuffed 
animal. I want for Christmas a 
little little puppy dog toy. I want 
Lilo cover. I want for Christmas 
is  Christmas lights. A stuffed 
animal turkey. Can I see you on 
Christmas Eve when you give me 
presents?  Thank you very much 
Santa.

I Love Santa.
 MIA CLARK

Dear Santa,
I want a Ipad and a toy truck. 

I want a to ybox, I already have 
one but  I need another one. Can 
I please get a new backpack for 
school…could it be Roblox please. 
I have been a very good boy at 
school.

Love, Brayden Randolph

Dear Santa,
What I want for Christmas this 

year is a Monster High School 
and Monster High dolls and a 
robe and highills and a Chrstmas 
water boter and thank you. Merry 
Christmas Santa.  Do you like red 
Santa? Can you fly? My sister 
wants Monster High School and 
Monster High dolls too. Oh, I have 
one last question. Do you like 
Christmas Santa?

Love, Hayden Sullivan

Dear Santa,
Can I please have the stuff on 

the list? I want a set of smiling 
critters and sprinki and a spell so 
Liam loves me. Can I have a cata-
pult and I want a kitten. Put holes 
in the box and paper. I am helping 
make cocooese. What

kind would you like? Would 
you like milk?

LOVE, VIVIAN MORRESSETTE

Dear Santa,
I have been a good boy this  

year. I saw you sent my elf Buddy. 
He’s been good so far. For Christ-
mas, I would like a book called 
Now in Full Color Captain Un-
derpants and The Attack of the 
Talking Toilets. I also would like 
this Nitendo game called Lego 
World. I hope the elfs are good at 
the North Pole. Merry Christmas 
Santa.

LOVE, RIAH MARQUEZ

Dear Santa,
I have been good this year 

and I would want mega bloks, a 
fast and fiores crocows, a new 
nitindo cards, a bawsee castle, a 
moster truck. I want a million dol-
lars, a pool, a new bike, and a lot 
of cars. Nova has been bad! I also 
would like a monster truck that I 
can drive. 

LOVE, AUDRIC CATES

DOYLE ELEMENTARY
WENDY PARKER 
AND MRS. CAYCE

Dear Santa,
I would like a balance beam 

and a record player.  Last year, I 
was so excited for the presents 
and I’m even more excited this 
year!  Thank you for all your 
presents!

FROM, ARLEE USERY

Dear Santa, 
This year, I want a dirt bike.  

And I also want a dirt bike for 
Eghan and a battery for our 
4-wheelers.

LOVE, SAWYER SPARKS

Dear Santa, 
I want a VR headset and a 

monitor and headset for a PC.
LOVE, GEORGE WEST

Dear Santa,
I love you! Give me everything 

I want and make it feel like a 
dream!  I will give you milk and 
cookies at Christmas!  I want an-
other elf and I want it to be a boy.  
I want Pokemon cards, legos, and 
stuffies!

LOVE, KOLT PARKER

Dear Santa,
I want a Nintendo Switch, awe-

some clothes, a Thanos figure, 
a stuffed toy, a nerf gun, a 3 x 
3 rubik’s cube, some shoes, a 
deadpool mask that lights up, a 
basketball pump, a car that I can 
control, and a telescope.

FROM, KORY VIGIL

Dear Santa,
I want a touchland, hover-

board go kart, bluey video game, 
clothes, summer fridays, bluey 
calendar, bingo stuffie, basketball 
shorts, uggs, stanley, build a bear 
shoes, 71 perfume, basketball wa-
ter bottle with my name, black 
leggins, microphone, globe, cam-
era film, and pipe cleaners.

LOVE, ELLIS MARTIN

Dear Santa,
I would like a pair of Nike 

Slides, and an indoor basketball 
hoop, a light up baseball, new 
basketball shoes, sweatpants and 
hoodies, a 2k25 games, a green 
football, and football jerseys.

FROM, NATHAN RANDOLPH

Dear Santa,
I wish for a Christmas mira-

cle, and some new skates please!  
And to spend lots of time with my 
family and an electric scooter.  A 
new basketball goal, a new hov-
erboard, and lots of lots of love!

LOVE, ZOEY KILGORE

Dear Santa, 
I want a polaroid camera, new 

perfume, a drawing set, and a 
new bike.  Also some new clothes.  
Thank you for these gifts!  Oh, 
and also a vanity!

LOVE, PHOENIX SIMPSON

Dear Santa,
I want a new binder like the 

one that Arlee has.  I also want 
black leggings.  I want bubbl the 
moisturizer, and a happy family.  I 
also want perfume 40, and 59 Sol 
De Janeiro.  

LOVE, LACEY DOSS

Dear Santa,
I want a Stanley and I want 

some makeup and skincare.  I 
want some dolls and I want some 
hoodies and some bracelets.  I 
want some soft pillows and a 
necklace.  I want nail polish-pink, 
purple, blue, and glitter nail pol-
ish.  I want Nike Shoes purple or 
pink and I want a soccer jersey.
LOVE, LYDIA RANDOLPH

Dear Santa,
I want clothes and winter 

clothes, games for my switch,  
Stitch stuff from Leo and Stitch.  
I don’t ask for much.  Please and 
thank you!

FROM, MAKENNA FARLEY

Dear Santa,
I want candy, makeup, a hair-

brush, a blanket, new shoes, toys, 
slime,and playdough.

LOVE, KENLEY FARLEY

Dear Santa,
I want socks, blacklight, play-

dough, an LOL doll, a Stanley, and 
a hello kitty.

FROM, SERENITY ROUPP

Dear Santa,
I love you because you give us 

gifts. Thank you for sharing your 
elves with us.  I wish for a water 
bottle Owala and a squishmallow.

FROM, DESTINY 

Dear Santa,
I dont want alot for Christmas 

but I just want some boots and 
some art stuff and maybe some 
Nike Socks.  That’s all. 

FROM, KENZIE

Dear Santa,
I want my one TV and I want 

a Nintendo Switch.  And I want 
legos, an r-car, and I want an 
army man.

FROM, JOHNATHAN GILLIAM

Dear Santa,
I want a manatee squishmal-

low, a live pet, a pet dragon, 
a smocky stuffy for Christmas, 
a helmet horse fire, and a teal 
Stanley.

FROM, EVERLY EDDS

DOYLE ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN

MISS ABBIE’S CLASS

Dear Santa, 
I want batman toys. 

FROM KAYDEN IRELAND

Dear Santa,
I want a bluey airplane, slap-

ping bracelet, and a board. 
FROM EMILEE JOHNSON 

Dear Santa, 
I have been a good boy all 

year. I would like block letters, 
motorcycle, airplane, cars, trucks, 
trains. 

Thank you.
 FROM NOAH BRYMER  

Dear Santa, 
Lots of toys with PS 5 and 

many toys for other kids. 
FROM BRENTLEY DOUGLAS

Dear Santa, 
This year for Christmas I would 

like a pretend washing machine, 
slime, aa play kitchen, and  new 
purse. I would also like a baby 
shopping cart. 

FROM KENSLEE SPARKMAN 

Dear Santa, 
I have been a good boy this 

year. I want a computer, a Christ-
mas stuffie, a big couch for my 
room, 4,000 Robux, and a Christ-
mas cup. I hope you have a good 
night delivering all the presents 
around the world. 

FROM RIVER SIMPSON

Dear Santa, 
I would like a big Hatchimal, 

mermaid barbie, LOL surprise 
doll, unicorn playdo set like the 
one at Walmart, and a Santa 
stuffie. Please tell Mrs. Claus I 
said hello and I have a dress just 
like hers. 

FROM RORI DENTON

Dear Santa, 
I want a batman toy, cars, Nike 

shoes. All I want to do is spend 
time with my family. 

FROM CONNOR RANDOLPH 

Dear Santa, 
I want a toy airplane, the blue 

bag that I saw at the store, lots 
of candy, a whole bunch of snow, 
and fifty-five cents. 

FROM ATHENA YOUNG

Dear Santa, 
My Name is Collins. I would 

like a barbie camper van that I 
can drive. And a tricycle for my 
brother . Please and Thank you! 

LOVE,  COLLINS BROWN

Dear Santa, 
I want a squishy box and a 

watch. I want markers and a rock, 
and shoes. I want some books. 

FROM EVERLY COPELAND

Dear Santa, 
I love you. I wish I had a toy 

dog. I wish I could see you. I 

would like a rock em sock em ro-
bots, slinky dog, fart gun, watch, 
bathset, walkie talkies, sonic stuff 
please, and warm camo clothes 
so I can deer hunt and bring my 
family stuff too please. 

FROM JAYSON DAVISON 

Dear Santa, 
I wish for Ben 10 toys, and a 

Ben 10 switch game. Also please 
give your elfs mini elf plushies, 
and I’ll be sure to leave you the 
most milk and cookies. 

FROM DAMON TUCK 

Dear Santa, 
I want an electric go cart, 

power-wheel monster truck, and 
a 4- wheeler for me to ride. 

FROM DUSTY MILEY

Dear Santa, 
I want makeup, squishmello, 

and a cat mask. 
FROM KIARA AUSTIN

Dear Santa, 
I want a helicopter, a dump-

truck, and a hunting set. 
FROM WYATT YOUNG

Dear Santa, 
I want bluey toys, pikachu, and 

monster trucks. 
FROM WILEY SCOTT 

Dear Santa, 
 I would like a bicycle, a tiny 

car, and a lego set. 
Thank you.

FROM ASHER LEE

DOYLE ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN
BREANNA LASKO

Dear Santa,
I want 3 sprunki plush toys. 

From,
MYLES

Dear Santa,
I think I have been a good girl 

this year. I would like more Bar-
bie’s at Mimi’s house. I would like 
a smaller Barbie house. I want a 
big Hello Kitty wall sticker.

FROM CHARLEE WINN

Dear Santa,
I want a Baby Doll. I want a 

Barbie Dream house. Barbies for 
my dream house. A baby doll 
bed. I want make up, with make 
up brushes. Toys for my baby 
doll.

FROM ARIA

Dear Santa,
I am Hunter Miller and I have 

been a good boy this year. I’d like 
a new leather jacket and 5 nights 
of fraddys toys.

Thank you Santa.
HUNTER MILLER

Dear Santa,
I love my Christmas pajamas. I 

hope you have cozy pajamas too. 
I love you.

From Charlotte C.

Dear Santa,
I want my family to be healthy 

and strong and get through what-
ever they’re fighting with in life I 
also wishing I will get a new truck 
to drive outside this summer.

FROM GRACELYNN KLAUSNER

Dear Santa,
I’m happy to get presents. 

Merry Christmas!
FROM HADLEY

Dear Santa,
I would like a toy float. I would 

also like some toy bluey’s, silly 
glasses.

 FROM DELILAH HIX

Dear Santa,
Marre Christmas I want an oc-

ulus From,
AXTON BRAZLE

Dear Santa,
 I would like a watch, Indo-

minus Rex Big stuffed t-rex ma-
rio game and blue headphones 
Thank you

FROM JAXON

Dear Santa,
I would like a xbox. I would like 

presenes for my family. 
FROM CURTIS

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like new 

transformers, Goo Jit Zu toys, 
Spiderman Action Figures. I also 
like legos, power Rangers, color-
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Sasha WilsonSasha Wilson
White County ClerkWhite County Clerk

MerryMerry
ChristmasChristmas
from...from...

From all Our StaffFrom all Our Staff
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Merry ChristmasMerry Christmas
We hope this holiday season delivers all the best to you 
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ing, Arts + Crafts, and Singing. My 
favorite colors are blue, Green, 
and Red. I would also enjoy a kid 
friendly dart board, New Shoes 
(Size 12), and a jacket that has a 
ninja mask.

FROM BRENDON HYMES

DOYLE ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

DANIELLE THEIRRY

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want robux 

1000 frim meo 1 fuom taip wa-
bee (1 million roblox gift cards), 
and beles pim lamdrgene (a Lam-
borgene), and toll oistr hug wu 
phone (throw in a tablet.).

LOVE, DAXTON

Dear Santa, 
For Christmas i want a pop-

pet because i like it. I also want a 
fan because it is fun. I love Santa 
because he givs prasinst. I want a 
lamrgene. I love Santa. 

LOVE, GREYSON

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I want a scate 

bord,  hows shoos, and some of 
the robots that fite and one of 
thos little drt bices.

LOVE, CARTER

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a big 

lambrgene. Do not frigate a Ifon 
fiftten. And dont frigate a big 
santa.

LOVE, JEFFERSON

Dear Santa, 
	For Christmas I want a Power 

Wheel Gator. I also want a new 
desk with dinosaur stickers on it. 
And I would also like a new tablet. 
Thank you for giving me presents. 
I will leave you a cookie and a 
glass of milk.

LOVE, HASTON

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a red 

pone with a purple pone, a big 
Lambo, a Brbe and a big Brbe 
drem hous, and macup. 

LOVE, EVELYN

Dear Santa, 
	For Christmas I want a bike 

and yoyo and a drtbicks and a 
globe and a xbox and a T.V. and 
a Basket ball and a camputr and 
a spider man and a romat cantrol 
car.

LOVE, KARSYN

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a laptop 

and a computr and a new phone 
case.

LOVE, WILLIAM

Dear Santa, 
	For Christmas I want a skate 

brod, Call of Duty, skutr and a 
bike! And a dron.

LOVE, JOSHUA

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a scot 

Boord and a wwe.
LOVE, MAVERICK

Dear Santa, 
	For Christmas I want my mom 

to Fil Butr, a Powerwheel and a 
frog.

LOVE, SCARLETT

Dear Santa, 
	For Christmas I want a craft-

ing kit, Ifen fifteen, a bunch of 
rlistic bAby ball and a rill fone.

LOVE, TINSLEE

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a Ninten-

do switch, drone, 1300000000 
robux and a lambo.

LOVE, SILAS 

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a trans-

former ax, a robot Hand, and lots 
of paper.

LOVE RYLAND

Dear Santa, 
	For Christmas I want a scat-

bord.
LOVE, PERSEPHONE

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want Blod and 

neoswr and bibrthukt (a super 
expensive truck) and boorssods 
and a biBrtaot (lambo).

LOVE, JOEL REESE

Dear Santa,
	For Chietmas I want a skat-

Bord, a gtar, Brbes and you can 

go to uthor peplls homs. Hey 
Santa do you hav yoor own Elf? I 
love you and ol The Elfs. 

LOVE, AMELIA

Dear Santa,
	For Christmas I want a skl-

apood (skateboard) and pikp 
(bike) and a forlorn and a sidsis 
and a foorokshp (4 wheeler) and 
a green sidsid (side by side).

LOVE, GUNNER

DOYLE ELEMENTARY
 FIRST GRADE

GIANNA HAWKINS

Dear Santa,
I would like a Eixploding 

Creeerrr. I would also like a New 
Lunch box. Next I want a sunny 
and melin Plushe. and a drone 
that can Flx! and a candy Ponne! 
tat has Rele buttons! and a Elf on 
the shelf! and some books!

LOVE, KEYARA

Dear Santa,
I would like a bike for Christ-

mas. I would also like an raseule-
chrik cave. do you no Trevre? he is 
so nise I luv him. he is so fune elf. 
he sat in my Dadr Truck. and he 
oso rot qnot. he seid yr mom is a 
Krase Trivre. Vrom vrom bep bep 
bep I am rendeg yr favrte. Nanna 
and papa elfls.

LOVE, JAXON

Dear Santa,
I would like a Nintendo and a 

Ballrenu Dres for christmas.
LOVE, ELEANOR

Dear Santa,
I would like a train for Christ-

mas. I would also like an engine. 
I want a Ninitendo switch. I also 
want a hoverboard.

LOVE, GUNNER
 

Dear Santa,
I would like an arsee car for 

Christmas. I would like a android 
fone for Christmas. I would like a 
computer.

LOVE, REMINGTON

Dear Santa,
I would like a Elfs for Christ-

mas. I would also like an engine. 
I want a RCee cars. I also want a 
cars bake.

LOVE, CHARLIE O

Dear Santa,
I would like a train. In i wlod 

like a yeye tore. In i wlo aso like 
a ben tor.

LOVE, CHARLIE M

Dear Santa,
I would like a Elf. a Nintendo 

Switch. I want a rc car. I also want 
a do bit, A fone.

LOVE, NOAH

Dear Santa,
I would like a train far a Bslab 

in a huvur Briirdin a jron in dinsu-
ors in a toy go cort in a fon in a 
invisible cloce.

LOVE, LEVI

Dear Santa,
I would like a marlo and 

browser toy for christmas. Want 
alslan bowser’s ship.

LOVE, ZION

Dear Santa,
I would like a xbox for christ-

mas. I would Nintendo switch. 
Fone 

LOVE, ETHEN
 
Dear Santa,
I would like a piano for christ-

mas. I also want a hoverboard 
and a dole hose and a iPhone.

LOVE, ADA

Dear Santa,
I would like the Legid of Zedd 

skyward sword for christmas. I 
would alsolike a Robot and an 
scrf last the Legid of Zeda start 
of wzdum.

LOVE, GRAYSON

Dear Santa,
I would like a cute baby. I 

would like a mreo game for 
christmas.

LOVE, AVA

Dear Santa,
I would like a transformer toy 

for christmas.
LOVE, JORDAN

Dear Santa,
I would like a dog for christ-

mas. I love you Santa.
LOVE, SILAS

Dear Santa,
I would like a shooter that 

shoots out marsmby and gas.
LOVE, LEO

Dear Santa,
I would like a Ben 10 Hmqsolr 

toy for christmas. Also Ben 10 onx 
tnx toy. Also a puppy.

LOVE, TRACY

DOYLE ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

LEAH SIMMONS

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me PS5. I would also like a dirt 
bike for my brother.

LOVE, JACE

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me a razr. A drbik with gas. I 
would also like apul wotch. Last, I 
want a trampulen. Can you bring 
new lon mowr for my momu?

LOVE, BRIAN

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me a stice ro bracelet. I would 
also like a mistrbest bascetbol. 
Last, I want a tine cat stuft animl.

LOVE, KASEN

Dear Santa, 
	I would love if you could bring 

me a braslit maker. I would also 
like a Pupetoe. Last, I want a 
blooe clomushen. Hay Santa do 
you like coce? Hay Santa do you 
like milk? Hay Santa do you like 
cereyal? Hay Santa I have ben 
good theis yir.

LOVE, KINLEY

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me bat min r see cor. I would also 
like a remot kontrol cor. Last, a r 
see cor monstrtruk.

LOVE, NOLAN

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me a bike. Also I would like a 
notebuk. Last I wont a wodring 
can. Dear Santa how do yor rane-
dars fliye?

LOVE, ROSALIE

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me squishmelose. I would also 
like a macup kit. Last I want a 
pokemn kars.

LOVE, KIMBER

Dear Santa, 
	I would love if you could bring 

me a gas powr fuwelr. Also arme 
set. Last I would wunt to hav a 
grat crismis. 

LOVE, OWEN

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me a Ps five. I would also like a 
footbol. Last I want a four welr 
four Nolan. What is your favlrit 
Kulr Santa Klos?

LOVE, CODY

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could biing 

me a strike row braslit. I would 
also like a kankursow pupey. Last, 
I watt a bff Braslit. I have bin nise 
this yir.

LOVE, HALLIE

Dear Santa,
	I wold love if you could bring 

me a crimas hoode. I would also 
like Ps5. Last, I want a toy car, I 
have bin good this yer.

LOVE, ASHER

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me a helo cite clomushen. I would 
al so like a doctr cit. Last, I want a 
intendo swich. Santa what is your 
soot mad awt of?

LOVE, EMERSON

Dear Santa, 
	I would love if you could bring 

me stickee roel brasllits. I would 
also like a Jax plush. Last I want 
a frend ship hrte necklaces. I like 
your clase.

LOVE, GABRIELLA

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me my litl pone cdindr. I would 
also like a stikr braslit. Last, I want 
a Lol dol. What is yor favrit cullr?

LOVE, HERMIONE

Dear Santa,
	I would love if you could bring 

me a Chrismus swetr. I would also 
like a bike. Last, cen you bring me 
a babe cat? Is it always a good 
day at the North Pole?
	 LOVE, HARPER

DOYLE ELEMENTARY 
SECOND GRADE
JENNY WEST

Dear Santa,
I would like a remote control 

car. Spiderman, Squishmellow 
and a book.

LOVE, RILEY SCOTT

Dear Santa,
I want a few L.O.L.s and a little 

stockings for my Barbies. Merry 
Christmas, Santa!

LOVE, CLAUDIA NEAL

Dear Santa,
Merry Christmas, Santa! Thank 

you for the Legos. I want a four-
wheeler.

Thank you!
LOVE, ARES YOUNG

Dear Santa,
I really want a toy from Poppy 

Playtime Place. Can I please have 
a PlayStation 5? I really want a 
Nintendo Switch. Thank you for 
the gifts if we are on the good list.

LOVE, WYATT MCKELVEY

Dear Santa,
I want my own skateboard 

and Barbie set. I also want those 
things you make Play-Doh into 
a little Squishmellow that smells 
like ice cream.

LOVE, ANNABELLE GOODWIN

Dear Santa,
How are you? I believe you 

are real. I want a Sonic Show and 
a PS5 and an astrobot game. I 
love you!

LOVE, ASHER TEMPLETON

Dear Santa,
Thank you for the presents 

last year. I want a VR and a PS5. 
Thank you!

LOVE, LIAM CARMICHAEL

Dear Santa,
I want a dog. I love you and 

have been excellent for you!
LOVE, GRACELYNN STRICKLAND

Dear Santa,
Hey Santa! I want a cat. I love 

you Santa and thank you for the 
presents.

LOVE, BRAELYN SLATTON

Dear Santa,
Thank you for the stuff you 

gave me last year. Can I have a 
black remote control Jeep?

LOVE, WESTEN JACKSON

Dear Santa,
I want makeup. I want some 

nails. I want some fake food. I 
want a bike and Merry Christmas, 
Santa.

LOVE, AVIE THOMAS

Dear Santa,
Are you feeling good? What 

I want for Christmas is a four 
wheeler, a Nerf Gun, and a new 
football. How is Mrs. Claus doing?

LOVE, DANIEL FLATT

Dear Santa,
I am so happy you sent us the 

Elf. I would like a Holobright. My 
class is so excited to have the Elf 
in the classroom.

LOVE, TYNSLEE GOOD

Dear Santa,
I would want 5 video games, 

a bike, and a punching bag too.
LOVE, LENNOX LEDBETTER

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN 
LINDSAY PORTER

Dear Santa,
My name is Emmery. I am five 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a watch, a kitty, 
and Coco Pebbles. 

YOUR FRIEND, EMMERY WHITWORTH

Dear Santa, 
My name is Ellis. I am five 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a telescope, 
microscope, and a drone.

YOUR FRIEND, ELLIS KALBARCZYK

Dear Santa,
My name is Alice. I am five 

(almost six) years old. This year I 

have been very good. For Christ-
mas this year, I would love a bike, 
a wagon, and a sparkly pillow.

YOUR FRIEND, ALICE FULKERSON

Dear Santa, 
My name is Noah. I am five 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love Jurassic World 
Lego sets, a robot dog, and a 
Nerf Stampede ECS N-Strike Au-
tomatic Blaster.

YOUR FRIEND, NOAH DANIELS

Dear Santa,
My name is Charlie. I am six 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a bike, wres-
tlers, and a gold chair.

YOUR FRIEND, CHARLIE GOINES

Dear Santa,
My name is Azra. I am five 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a Spiderman, a 
guitar, and a basketball. 

YOUR FRIEND, AZRA BAKER

Dear Santa,
My name is Thomas. I am 

five years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love an electric 
scooter, a cowboy hat, and a 
hand-holder blower.

YOUR FRIEND, THOMAS GUY

Dear Santa, 
My name is Jeminygh. I am 

five years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love Barbie 
dolls, Baby toys, and a doll for 
Journey, things to draw and color 
with. Love you! 

YOUR FRIEND, JEMINYGH RIGOLI

Dear Santa,
My name is Axel. I am five 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a farming game, 
and monster trucks. 

YOUR FRIEND, AXEL MCKINLEY

Dear Santa, 
My name is Onna. I am five 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love unicorn items, 
unicorn clothes, and unicorn pj’s 
and house coat.

YOUR FRIEND, ONNA MOSHER

Dear Santa,
My name is Adalyn. I am 

five years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love a Jellycat 
stuffed animal, cowgirl boots, and 
a watch.

YOUR FRIEND, ADALYN ELROD

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN
MRS. MEADOWS 

Dear Santa,
My name is Tucker Bouter and 

I am six years old. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love a camera, 
a Hot Wheel set and a pet rabbit.

YOUR FRIEND, TUCKER

Dear Santa,
My name is Danica Dennis and 

I am six years old. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love a VR head-
set, a pet bird and a toy camper.	

YOUR FRIEND, DANICA

Dear Santa,
My name is Michael Heise and 

I am six years old. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love a toy plane, 
a Sprunky, a toy Santa and an elf.	

YOUR FRIEND, MICHAEL

Dear Santa,
My name is Nova Humphrey 

and I am six years old. This year I 
have been very good.  For Christ-
mas this year, I would love roller 
skates, a Barbie doll and a Stitch 
pillow.		

YOUR FRIEND, NOVA

Dear Santa,
My name is Gabriel Mabe and I 

am five years old. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love a Sonic the 
Hedgehog, Minion toys and some 
Robux for Roblox.			

YOUR FRIEND, GABRIEL

Dear Santa,
My name is Layla Maddox and 

I am six years old. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love some baby 
dolls, an Easy Bake oven and a 
jewelry making set.	

YOUR FRIEND, LAYLA

Dear Santa,
My name is Jessie Randolph 

and I am five years old. This year I 
have been very good.  For Christ-
mas this year, I would love a little 
baby that crawls, a unicorn and 
some art stuff.

YOUR FRIEND, JESSIE

Dear Santa,
My name is Waylon Stephens 

and I am six years old. This year I 
have been very good.  For Christ-
mas this year, I would love a 
remote control car, some games 
and a jeep.			 
Your friend, Waylon

Dear Santa,
My name is Addison Swack 

and I am five years old. This 
year I have been very good.  For 
Christmas this year, I would love a 
Stanley cup, a pony and a remote 
control car.		

YOUR FRIEND, ADDISON

Dear Santa,
My name is Samuel Usrey and 

I am six years old. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love a T-Rex, 
a Godzilla and some Pokemon 
cards.		

YOUR FRIEND, SAMUEL

Dear Santa,
My name is Owen Vandergriff 

and I am five years old. This year I 
have been very good.  For Christ-
mas this year, I would love a car, 
some Robux and a Vikings bed 
set.			

YOUR FRIEND, OWEN

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

AMANDA SELBY

Dear Santa,
I hope you have a great day 

at the north pole. Santa I want a 
hoverboard and some coles.

LOVE, LUCY JO P.

Dear Santa, 
Santa have a good Christmas! 

For Christmas I would  like some 
makeup. For Christmas we would 
like some candy. For Christmas I 
would like stuffed animals.

LOVE, ZOE R.

Dear Santa,
I will give you ecru cookes on 

Christmas.
LOVE, JAXTIN W.

Dear Santa,
I  hope the north pole is  go-

ing well. 
Toy list
559 skoshmelos
9000 robux gifts    
400 dino toys

LOVE, EZRA S.

Dear Santa,
I hope you sol me on titok. I 

want for christmas is a noow re-
mote control car.

LOVE, GIBSON W.

Dear Santa,
I wot a glitr pelo.

LOVE, THEA F.

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I won’t…
1.minecraft toys
2.sonic games
3.legos to build with
4.a cross
5.a toy ring
6.lakey box
7.poop robot

LOVE, JENSEN W.

Dear Santa,
I want a big slide and a sweeg 

set.
LOVE, KINZLEE P.

Dear Santa,
Is  the  north pole  ok? I wont  

slime. I wont  a  bike. I want a 
baby doll. I  wont slime. I  want a  
dog. I want  a   cat. I want another 
baby boy. I wont squshmelo. I 
want  a   swing  set.

LOVE, RENLY I.

Dear Santa,
How are you doing? I wunt 

2 lols.

CONTINUED ON 6A
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LOVE, RYLEE D.

Dear Santa,
I  want  a  cake  stufy.                

LOVE, SAMUEL R.

Dear Santa,
l wood like a glider pilot and 

a jacket. And  shoos. I want a 
swoosh meloe.

LOVE, TINSLEY B.

Dear Santa,
Happy Christmas, give Santa 

a lot of kooces and milk. Give 
people a lot of presents.

LOVE, OWEN W.

Dear Santa,
Santa I  hope the  nofpol is go-

ing good.  My Christmas list is a rc 
car,  backpack and plado.

LOVE,  JACOB S.

Dear Santa,
I wot for christmas of rc car. 

LOVE,  JAXON R.

Dear  Santa,
I hope you have a good day. 

All I want for Christmas is make-
up.

LOVE, PAIZLEE B.

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE
DANI DUNN

Dear Santa,
How many days until Christ-

mas? I have been good. I would 
like vbux, a stanley, a robe, board-
game, and a drone. I need a cross 
necklace and football gloves. For 
my mom I want to get her per-
fume. For my dad, binoculars be-
cause he loves to go hunting. For 
Azluin, I want to get him a basket-
ball. Thank you, Santa. 

LOVE, ELI

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like to 

have a tablet, a pet lizard, mini 
brands, pet corn snake and   spar-
kly boots. I  need new clothes. I 
would like to get dad Legos and 
I already got mom something. I 
would like to get Nathaniel a new 
toy truck. For Lennox a teething 
toy that he can bite on because 
he lost his. For JC I want to get 
her a fidget.  Thank you Santa!

LOVE, ADI

Dear Santa,
What is your favorite reindeer? 

I have been good. For Christmas 
l wood like batman, craft and a 
robin figure. Also I would like a 
minecraft sleeping bag. For mom 
I want to get her something with 
Jack the Skeleton because she is 
obsessed. Maybe socks because 
she doesn’t have those, or shoes. 
For William I want to get him a 
new bed that is bigger and can 
hold three people. For my cat, I 
want to get it a play area because 
she gets the Zoom zooms. Thank 
you Santa! 

LOVE, COLTON

Dear Santa,
How many days until Christ-

mas? I have been good this year, 
maybe. For Christmas I would 
like a couch, toy restaurant, and 
a Pac-Man machine. I need new 
clothes. For dad I would like 
to get him Elf soap. For mom I 
would like to get her flowers. For 
Nannie I got her a whistle. Thank 
you Santa!

LOVE, HAYDEN

Dear Santa,
Which   reindeer is  your fa-

vorite ?  I have    been    good 
for Christmas, I   would    like    
barbies, a pet turtle, and a new 
cat toy. I need a scarf. For mom 
I want to get her a Wednesday 
sweater. For dad I want to get 
him a packer cup. For Memaw I 
want to get her a picture. Thank 
you Santa! 

LOVE, KYRIE

Dear Santa
For Christmas I would like a 

Kuromi plush and a bag of cook-
ies and a unicorn night light. I 
need new toothpaste and sham-
poo. For mom I want to get her 
toothpaste. For Dad, I want to 
get him shampoo. For my sister 
a similar plush to mine. For my 
brother, I want to get him a Pom 
Pom plush. Thank you Santa! 

LOVE, RYLIE

Dear Santa,
How do your eleves move?I am 

trying to be good this year. For 

Christmas, I would like, 100,000 
robux, a computer, nintendo, and 
Minecraft. I need some new blue 
jeans. For my sister I would like to 
get her a doll house. For mom, a 
shirt that says I love you. Thank 
you Santa! 	

LOVE, ALLEN

Dear Santa,
How do you get to my home? 

I have been okay this year. For 
Christmas, I would like a punch-
ing bag, some weights, a pull up 
bar, a treadmill, a robot, and a 
PS5. I need a new belt. I would 
like to get my brother play doh. 
For mom, I would like to get her 
a candle and dad a gun. Thank 
you Santa!

LOVE, JAX

Dear Santa,
For christmas I would like a 

lamborghini, a challenger, a mus-
tang and a BMW. I need new 
clothes. For my sister, I would 
like to get her a barbie. For dad I 
would like to get him a jacket, and 
for grandma some clothes.

Thank you Santa!
LOVE, LUCAS

Dear Santa,
Can I please have a ballerina 

tutu, a robot cat, and a cat toy be-
cause i really like cats. I need new 
dresses. For my mom I would 
like to get her a necklace like she 
asked for. For my Nana, she said 
I could get her anything I like so 
I would get her new shoes. For 
Papa, I would get him new boots 
and slippers. Thank you Santa! 

LOVE, ANNABELLE

Dear Santa,
Which cookie do you like? I 

have been good this year. For 
Christmas I would like a VR head-
set, cash, a nice plushie, a new 
bike and a Mustang GT. I need 
some new gloves. For Papa I 
would like to get him my Mustang 
GT. For Grandma, I would like to 
get her $100. For my brother, I 
would like to get him a VR head-
set and my sister a doll set. Thank 
you Santa! 

LOVE, BRAXTON

Dear Santa,
Does Mrs. Claus bake cook-

ies? For Christmas I would like 
make up, a toy bird, and a drum. 
I need some new shirts. For my 
mom I would like to get her an 
iPhone. My dad wants some new 
tools. Memaw needs more medi-
cine and my dogs need new toys. 
My cat needs mittens. Thank you 
Santa! 

LOVE, WINTER

Dear Santa,
For Christmas, I would like a 

Stanley, a lamborghini, a purse, 
10 robux and an iPhone. I need a 
new coat. For Skylar, I would like 
to get her a Stanley. I would like 
to get Makenzie a flying fairy. For 
my little sister, I would like to get 
her a baby doll. Thank you Santa! 

LOVE, OLIVIA

Dear Santa,
Where do you sleep? I have 

been good. I would like a Lego 
car, board games and a toy car. 
I need new socks. For Roman I 
would get him a Lego car. I would 
get a fidget spinner for Morgan. I 
would like to get a dress for my 
mom and a Tennessee hat for my 
dad. Thank you Santa! 

LOVE LOGAN

Dear Santa,
Who makes the food? I was 

trying to be good this year. For 
Christmas, I want a VR headset, 
an action figure, and a blue rain-
bow friend. I need new pants. For 
my mom, I would like to get her 
a new microwave. For my dad, I 
would like to get him new glasses. 
Thank you Santa! 

LOVE, EZRA

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE
KIM LUNA

Dear Santa,
I would like a hatchable. Dear 

Santa I would like something for 
my sister a care bear. Dear santa 
I would like something for my 
sweet mommy a necklace. Dear 
Santa I would like something for 
my dad. He would like a pack of 
magic cards. Dear Santa I would 
like a squish mellow. Dear Santa 
I would like a pack of Pac-Man 
cards.

THANK YOU, DELILAH

Dear Santa,
I would like a monster truck, 

PS5, and a headset with a con-
troller.

THANK YOU, CLARENCE

Dear Santa,
I would like a dirt bike and a 

new football. Can I have a new 
football helmet? Can you get my 
moma a new van? Can you get 
my moma a new Iphone? Can you 
get my dad a new truck? Can you 
get my dad a new phone? Can 
you get Enoch a new phone? Can 
you get Reddy a new phone? Can 
you get Reddy a new playstation? 
Can you get Marcus a new elec-
tronic car?

THANK YOU, MAX

Dear Santa,
I want a basketball that goes 

on the door. I want a cross with 
a Jesus figure. I want a remote 
control car. I want a gold chain 
with a cross on it for me. My dad 
wants 1000K. My mom wants a 
1000K. My sister wants a cooking 
set. My brother wants 1000K. My 
Jesus wants a blessing. My Jesus I 
love you, You Jesus are my Savior.

THANK YOU, BRANTLEY

Dear Santa,
My mom would want a vase 

for flowers. Dear Santa my dad 
would want a gun to kill pigs 
and cows. Dear Santa I want an 
IPhone. Dear Santa my friend 
would want a phone. Dear Santa 
my grandmall would want a Bible. 
Dear Santa my sister would like a 
puppy. Dear Santa my youngest 
sister would want a basketball. 
Dear Santa my family would want 
an Elf. Dear Santa I want a watch. 
Dear Santa my dog wants toys 
to chew on. Dear Santa my sister 
would want a sonic card. Dear 
Santa my cousin would want a 
guitar.

THANK YOU, ARMY

Dear Santa,
I want a hoverboard from you 

Santa. I will make you cookies 
for you. I will give your reindeer 
food. I think that my sister wants  
a craft set. My mom wants an 
American flag. My dad wants a 
new American watch.

THANK YOU, ADDILYNN

Dear Santa,
I want art supplies for me. 

For my mom I want makeup. For 
my sister I want a baby doll. For 
my dad I want a basketball. For 
my puppy a cup. For my cousin 
I want a baby toy. For my Omall 
a tshirt. For my nana a new com-
puter. For Savana a salon. 

THANK YOU, RYLEE

Dear Sanat,
Mrs. Carleen needs a new key-

pad in the cafeteria under my 
Christmas tree. And for my lit-
tle sister a toy unicorn. And for 
my big sister a barbie house for 
my sister Allie. For my mom for 
Christmas to give my mom a new 
spatula. And for my Dad some 
guns to play not a real live gun. 
And for my Dad a lots and lots 
and lots of money so he can get 
a Sonic toy. And for my dog dog 
treats. And for my meme a hug. 
And for me a I want a nintendo 
switch. Santa thank you. 

CONRAD

Dear Santa,
For my dad I want a Lego ta-

ble. For my mom I want a picture. 
For my grandmal I want bees. For 
me I want 100 LOL dolls, barbie 
house, barbie clothes, 10 alive 
dolls, baby alive clothes, 100 dol-
lars, cat, computer, camera, and 
headphones, a wig and a seven 
shirt..

THANK YOU, MARLEY

From Renley to Santa,
For me I want some LOL dolls. 

For my mom I want her to have 
some kitchen supplies. For my 
dad I want him to have a remote 
control robot that goes upside 
down. For my cousin Aspin she 
wants a baking machine Tasty 
Cake. For Aser a Sonik toy. Akmin 
wants a toy car. Adveonu wants a 
squish mellow. For my grandma 
I want her to have a pot for her 
kitchen. For my grandpa I want 
him to have a new game for all of 
us to play. For my dog I want him 
to have some treats. For my cat 
some treats too.
	 THANK YOU, RENLEY

Dear Santa,
First Jake I want to get him 

a video game for Christmas. For 
me a video game. For my dad a 
gun. For my Mom flowers. For 
my baby brother a toy. For Rale 
a heart cushion. For Horle a heart 
because I love her.

THANK YOU, JONAS

Dear Santa,
I want my sis to have an 

IPhone. I want my brother to 
have an IPhone. I want my mom 
to have a Christmas shirt. I want 
my dad to have Christmas socks. 
I want to have a monkey. I want to 
my dog to have a dog toy. I want 
my lizard to have a new helmet. I 
want my mom dog to be happy. 
I want my six little dogs to be 
happy.

THANK YOU, AVA

Dear Santa,
Can you get me a remote con-

trol car? Santa can you get my 
sister a chromebook? Can you 
get my mom a new phone case? 
Dear Santa can you get my dad 
new boots?

THANK YOU, MICHAEL

Dear Santa,
I want a birthstone ring. I want 

to get my sister makeup. For my 
sis I want a green shirt.

THANK YOU, ALIYAH

Dear Santa,
I want a silicone doll and 

please make it pretty. For my dad 
a Bible. For my mom a Bible and 
could you tell God to let everyone 
to have Gods spirit. For my sister 
jewelry and for my brother Santa 
a pillow.

THANK YOU I LOVE YOU.TATUM

Dear Santa,
I want a PS5, a headset, a 

painting, and that’s it. For my 
mom I want her to have a coffee 
mug. For my dad a pocket knife. 
For Jack a basketball game. For 
Saydee a Taylor Swift book. For 
Sam a chain necklace. For Jace a 
nintendo switch. SK a spanking.

THANK YOU SANTA, LINCOLN
			

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE
NORA MOTT

Dear Santa,
how is Rudolph the red noz 

deer boing rit naw?  I wood like a 
noow dike and a fone.  Well you 
plez giv miy bad and mom and 
Candise gifts. They have not bin 
bab.  Santa, you are the best.

LOVE, MADDOX F.

Dear Santa,
Why do you get to eat milk 

and cookies and not me?  I would 
like America to be a better place 
for Christmas.  I would also like 
science toys and a stuffed animal, 
a wolf.  I want Taxton to have a 
cocomelon toy.  Santa, I also want 
my mom to have a diamond ring.

LOVE, CASH C.

Dear Santa,
Do you like cookies?  I well 

make you cookies.  Will rudolph 
get me ine sankeng pransese.  I 
would want a drt bike.  Levi wants 
a spaceship to

car.  I wish for you to get to see 
me at chuck shes  ples.  Thank 
you

Santa. Bye.
LOVE, HUNTER H.

Dear Santa, How are your 
elves?  are They wcing Hard?  
and what cookies Do you like 
to?  I would like a wace toces and 
Grinch doll, Elbo pas and ney pas.  
I like my mom to get a srt for 
Christmas.  Thac you Santa.

LOVE, BAILEY B.

Dear Santa,
What kind of cookies do you 

like?  I would like a bear.  I want to 
gift Caterenna school supplies.  I 
want to gift Kimberly uno cards.  
Than you

Santa!
LOVE, KATHRYN G.

Dear Santa,
What is the reindeerts favret 

food? I wold want a spider-man 
clok. And a bayblade s set.  And 
a spider-man mask that has a sich 
to make it cool and for it to lite up.  
And a Ben, 10 Omyvres wach and 
jaket.  And a spi kit. And a vr head 
ste. And robux.

LOVE, WINSTON

Dear Santa,
Can I plees have all of the 

Godzilla toys and Godzilla play 
sets?  And can I have a Pokemon 
bindr plees.  And a dinosaur Hot 
will set. And all of this for my 
druthr Kyson to and I want to 
git my bruthr to.  And all of the 
sinse icspermits plees. I love you. 
Hapee Crismis.

LOVE, XANDER O.

Dear Santa,
What is Rudolph boing? I 

would like a peyr of roluskast.  I 
want my bruthr to git a presit and 
I thank my mom and dad would 
like soothing.  Thak you Santa.

LOVE, MAVERY J.

Dear Santa,
How is my elf doing?  dear 

Santa, can I have a toy hamstr? 
Can me and Jace have more dra-
gen ball sooper toys and can I 
have a barbe dream haws?

LOVE, ELLIE M.

Dear Santa,
Will you do inething for Christ-

mas?  Can I plees hav Lilue the 
Umerich grl dol and Molee and 
Rupunsi the Umericig grl.  Can I 
giv mi moma soothing that she 
lies. She likse clos. Mere Chrismas 
Santa.

LOVE, ANNIE H.

Dear Santa,
What cind of cookies would 

you like Santa?  I would like prins-
es Ameriken gril dolls and I also 
would like a SleepingBuoody 
wache. I would like my bruthr to 
have animal puzzles.  I woud like 
my mom to have a mushen that 
washes lonjree.  I woud like my 
dad to have a gift card.  I woud 
like my dog Wally to have treets. 
Thank you Santa!

LOVE, WILLOW M.

Dear Santa,
I wnt a top sibr chuk. Mom wnt 

a canlg. Dad wnt a noo boots.
LOVE, BRIGGS B.

Dear Santa,
Harw is Rudoph doeeing?   I 

would like a toy rsee cor that is a 
sidbre tuk and a nurture rsee cor. 
a nocee srt. I wnt a nicee prolvre. 
maree prisms. Thac you Santa.

LOVE, COLSON B.

Dear Santa,
What dus yo’re slay run on? 1. 

I would like you to breg me the 
intiyer Sonic the hendcho set. 2. I 
would like you to breg me a ifon 
16 pro. 3. I would like you to breg 
me a PS 5. 4. I would like you to 
breg me a nutenow switch.  5. I 
would like you to breg me a jep. 
6. I would like you to breg me a 
xbox. 7. I would like you to breg 
me a dut bike. 8. I would like 
you to breg me 100,000,000. 
9.  I would like you to breg me 
a mechin.  10. I would like you to 
breg me a sibchuck.

LOVE, CARTER G.

Dear Santa,
You liv in the North pole, and 

when is my elf gunu be here? I 
wud like goo git soos. I want my 
dad to have the stoongst air soft 
gun in the eaerth.

Thank you, Santa.
LOVE, MARZ M.

Dear Santa,
I wnt a rc car. I wnt a crstal rok. 

I wnt a vbuks. I wnt robux.
LOVE, OAKLEY D.

FINDLAY ELEMENTARY
RHONDA GIRDLEY

Dear Santa, 
My name is Texanna Whiteak-

er. I am 5 years old. I go to Findlay 
School.  I am in Ms. Girdley’s class. 
This year I have been very good.  
For Christmas this year, I would 
love a donkey, chickens, and a 
computer.

YOUR FRIEND, TEXANNA

Dear Santa, 
My name is Autumn Cox. I am 

6 years old. I go to Findlay School.  
I am in Ms. Girdley’s class. This 
year I have been very good.  For 
Christmas this year, I would love 
a bike and helmet, a Wednesday 
Barbie, and a Wednesday baby 
doll.

YOUR FRIEND, AUTUMN

Dear Santa, 
My name is Annelise Hinden-

berger. I am 5 years old.  I go to 
Findlay School and I am in Ms. 

Girdley’s class.  This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love a cleaning 
set, a Nike shirt, hover board.

YOUR FRIEND, ANNELISE

Dear Santa, 
My name is Julia Evans. I am 5 

years old.  I go to Findlay School 
and I am in Ms. Girdley’s class this 
year. This year I have been very 
good.  For Christmas this year, 
I would love Barbies, a Dream 
House, and a telescope.

YOUR FRIEND, JULIA

Dear Santa, 
My name is London Foster. I 

am 6 years old and I go to Findlay 
School.  I am in Ms. Girdley’s kin-
dergarten class.  This year I have 
been very good. 

For Christmas this year, I 
would love tennis shoes, a clean-
ing set, and a t-shirt.

YOUR FRIEND, LONDON

Dear Santa, 
My name is Owen Webb. I 

am 6 years old.  I am in Ms. Gird-
ley’s kindergarten class at Findlay 
School.This year I have been very 
good.  For Christmas this year, I 
would love a dirt bike, a batman 
toy, and cars.

YOUR FRIEND, OWEN

Dear Santa, 
My name is Rex Simpson. I am 

5 years old.  This year I have been 
very good. I go to Findlay School 
and I am in Ms. Girdley’s kinder-
garten class.

For Christmas this year, I 
would love Ninja kids, a sword, 
and a scythe.

YOUR FRIEND, REX

Dear Santa, 
My name is Darrik Dean. I am 

6 years old.  I am in kindergarten 
at Findlay School and Ms. Girdley 
is my teacher. This year I have 
been very good.  For Christmas 
this year, I would love cowboy 
boots, a cowboy hat, and a mon-
ster truck.

YOUR FRIEND, DARRIK

Dear Santa, 
My name is Nixon McClausand. 

I am 5 years old.  I go to Findlay 
School.  I am in kindergarten and 
Ms. Girdley is my teacher. This 
year I have been very good. For 
Christmas this year, I would love 
a guitar, army toys, and a piano. 

YOUR FRIEND, NIXON

Dear Santa, 
My name is Dale Rhea. I am 

6 years old.  I am in Ms. Gird-
ley’s kindergarten class at Findlay 
School. This year I have been very 
good. 

For Christmas this year, I would 
love a PS5, candy, and robux.

YOUR FRIEND, DALE

Dear Santa, 
My name is Lyle Melton. I am 5 

years old.  I go to Findlay School.  
I am in Ms. Girdley’s kindergarten 
class. This year I have been very 
good. 

For Christmas this year, I 
would love a Nintendo Switch, fly 
drone with camera, and my sister 
a Barbie House and dolls.

YOUR FRIEND, LYLE

Dear Santa, 
My name is Colton Kirby. I 

am 5 years old. I am in Ms. Gird-
ley’s kindergarten class at Findlay 
School. This year I have been very 
good.  For Christmas this year, I 
would love a cowboy rope, a toy 
horse, and a toy bull.

YOUR FRIEND, COLTON

NORTHFIELD ELEMENTARY
KINDERGARTEN

SARAH FUQUA-BENNETT

Dear Santa,
I want an airplane and a car for 

Christmas.  Bring some presents 
for Daddy and Mommy too.

LOVE, GWENDOLYN BOCHY

Dear Santa,
I want a Husky stuffie and a 

Barbie cup.  I want flowers to 
decorate and a Gecko toy.  Bring 
my sister some character Bar-
bie’s.  I will leave cookies and milk 
for you.  I love you, Santa.

LOVE, ADDI BOULDIN

Dear Santa,
Can I please have a doctor 

set and a play-dough set?   I also 
want a coloring set and a note-
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book.  Can I have a Ken doll?  I will 
leave you cookies and milk and 
some carrots for your reindeer.

LOVE, WINSLEY BRAWNER

Dear Santa,
I want a Bluey house and a 

Chilli doll for Bluey.  I also want 
little tiny luggage for my dolls and 
a tiny kid Barbie.  I want carpet 
for my dolls.  I think we are going 
to make you cookies and milk too.

LOVE, LYDIA DAVIS 

Dear Santa,
I want a Hoverboard and new 

Lego’s for Christmas.  Bring my 
brother some hunting stuff.  I will 
leave you some cookies.

LOVE, LANDON DODSON  

Dear Santa,
I want a remote control truck 

that can drive in the dirt.  I want a 
remote control car that uses bat-
teries, not one that has to charge.  
I will have Jell-o, cookies, and milk 
for you.

Love, Lincoln Henderson 

Dear Santa,
I want a monster truck that 

drives on the water and a safe.  I 
also want a hedgehog action fig-
ure and a dragon toy.  I am going 
to have cookies and milk for you.  
Also, bring another safe for my 
big brother Maverick.

LOVE, SCOUT JONES

Dear Santa,
Happy Christmas!  I want a 

boy baby doll and a remote con-
trol racecar.  I want an Ice Mon-
ster truck too.  I will leave you a 
note and a picture.

LOVE, WESTON MEYERS

Dear Santa,
I want a Stitch stuffy and a 

Pikachu Squishmallow.  I want 
a Sonic action figure that says 
words when you touch its’ belly.  
Please get my brother a dinosaur 
Squishmallow that has a smiley 
face.  I am going to leave you 
cookies.  Also, bring my baby 
sister a Minnie Mouse toy.

LOVE, CHRIS NASH

Dear Santa,
I like you, Santa.  I want a Mr. 

Beast Lab toy and a Bumble-
bee Autobot.  Bring my sister an 
Axolotl Squishmallow toy and my 
brother a toy shotgun.  Thank you 
for the presents.  I will have cook-
ies and milk.

LOVE, DECLAN PHIFER

Dear Santa,
Can I have a Barbie dream 

house?  Will you bring me a toy 
car and a cat stuffie?  I will leave a 
picture for you and some cookies 
with milk.

LOVE, QUINN ROJAS

Dear Santa,
I want an Axolotl Squishmal-

low and Barbie toys.  Please bring 
my brother some cars and dino-
saur toys.  I want a play-dough 
toy that has a moth to put teeth in 
it.  Bring a Sonic toy for Bubbie.  I 
will leave you some pizza.

LOVE, MADDIE SIGLER

NORTHFIELD ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

CHELSEA WHITE

Dear Santa,
 My name is Bentley. I am 6 

years old. For Christmas I would 
like every Pokemon thing in the 
world. 

FROM BENTLEY

Dear Santa, 
I want a turtle and a PS5 and 

a coffee machine for Christmas. I 
have been good. 

FROM SAWYER

Dear Santa,
My name is Zayden. I am 7 

years old. This year I have been 
nice. For Christmas this year, I’m 
wishing for a snow cone machine.

FROM ZAYDEN
 
Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old. This Year I 

have been nice. For Christmas, I 
am wishing for chocolate coins 
and candy canes, gingerbread 
men, and ornaments for my tree 
in my room. 

FROM LAYLAH

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old. I have been 

nice. For Christmas I want a Harry 
Potter book and Pokemon cards.

FROM LOGAN

Dear Santa, 
I want a new car to ride in. 

Mine is white and it’s really old. 
I want a Jeep one that is red. I 
want a toy gun too. That’s it. 

FROM KAYLIN 

Dear Santa, 
I am 7 years old. I have been 

nice this year. I would like Legos 
and Beyblade, a remote control 
car, and Pokemon. 

FROM GRAYSON

Dear Santa,
My name is Slade. I am 6 years 

old. I have been good. For Christ-
mas I would like a Pokemon and 
I want basketballs and I want 
Transformers and I want an elf 
and a dirt bike. 

FROM SLADE

Dear Santa, 
I love my family and my 

friends. I would like to ask for a 
bark bark dog that is a puppy 
for Christmas and for my family 
to have Christmas wishes come 
true and my friends to have their 
wishes too.

FROM QUINN

Dear Santa, 
For Christmas I want a stuffie 

that looks like you. And I want 
slippers that look like you. And 
Roblox gift cards. And $100,000. 
And a girlfriend. I also want a shirt 
and pants that look like you. And 
a McDonalds gift card. 

LOVE, BARRETT

Dear Santa, 
My name is Emeelia. I am 6 

years old. This year, I have been 
nice. For Christmas, I’m wishing 
for a new American girl doll that 
has curly hair and a new elf for my 
bedroom. 

LOVE, EMEELIA

Dear Santa, 
My name is Savanna. I’m 7. I’ve 

been good. I want a fake car and 
a pig toy with a bottle with a col-
lar and leash. I want fake make-
up and fake baby doll. I want a 
basketball and a stuffed unicorn 
and a bubblegum machine with 
quarters. 

FROM SAVANNA

Dear Santa, 
I want a VR headset for Christ-

mas. I have been very good in-
deed. 

FROM GUNNAR

Dear Santa, 
I was being good today. For 

Christmas I would like a Godzil-
la toy and Optimus Prime and 
Bumblebee. Lastly but not least, 
a Sonic the Hedgehog toy.

FROM HENRY

Dear Santa, 
I want a Warner Brothers wa-

ter tower, just one. 
RONNIE

NORTHFIELD ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE

MELANIE GOODWIN

Dear Santa,
I have been good this year! I 

want Lego’s, Squishmellows, and 
a necklace for christmas please. 
My sister wants a Miss Rachel doll 
please. When will my elf Carmen 
be back?

LOVE, FREYA TOLLISON

Dear Santa,
I would like a VR headset 

please. I also love Wednesday 
Adams and would love a doll that 
looks like her. Tell Rudolph hello! 
Merry Christmas!

ARI GIBSON

Dear Santa,
My name is Lucas and I have 

been good this year. I would like 
an RC car for Christmas.

LOVE, LUCAS PETERMAN

Dear Santa,
My name is Ranger Roberts. I 

am 8 years old. I want an electric 
scooter for Christmas. I also want 
v-bucks, a hunting game, and 
LED lights for my room. 

LOVE, RANGER 

Dear Santa,
I want an American Girl doll 

and matching clothes. I also want 
an American Girl bunk bed.

LOVE, ADELINE

Dear Santa,
I want new accessories for my 

American Girl doll, a real horse, 
and a fanny pack. I would also 
like a new and bigger Stanley 
cup. I would like a new make-up 
box, new make-up, a Lulu wallet, 
some candy, a phone, and a baby 
brother. 

LOVE, JEMMA RANDOLPH

Dear Santa,
I have been good. I want 5 

packs of Littlest Pet Shops, some 
make-up, a giant kitty Squishmel-
low, a Barbie with a cat, a Ken 
doll, and a new purple purse with 
cats on it. Thank you and Merry 
Christmas.

LOVE, CECILY ANN RANDOLPH-PASLEY

Dear Santa,
I want a Catnap stuffie and a 

Catnap costume. I want a tiger 
stuffie. I want Mindcraft sheets. I 
want a tiger blanket. I want green 
skates. I want a green bike. I want 
a blue helmet. I want a skate-
board. I want a Mindcraft coloring 
book.

LOVE, JUDAH THORNTON

Dear Santa,
I want a baby doll. I want a 

new i-Pad, new shoes, a baby doll 
stroller, candy, coloring books, a 
hoodie, and movies. I also want to 
see my sister Mak and Savanah, 
they live in New Jersey. 

LOVE, BROOKLYN HIEMSTRA

Dear Santa,
I would like a VR headset, 

a motorcycle, and a Nintendo 
Switch.

LOVE, DRAKE CARUTHERS

Dear Santa,
I hope everyone gets on the 

good list and not put on the 
naughty list. What about you? 
Happy Christmas! 

LOVE, BRYSON LINER

WOODLAND PARK
 ELEMENTARY

KINDERGARTEN
GRACIE VILLARD

Dear Santa,
I would like 2 slime lickers, a 

Bug Juice in my stocking, Bar-
bies, some LOL surprises, new 
clothes, and Spider-Man shoes. 
I also want every kid to get toys 
and have a good Christmas.

LOVE, ALLIE

Dear Santa,
I’ve been nice and good to my 

friends. Also I want a toy elf be-
cause I like elves. Also I would like 
a new Barbie. I hope you eat my 
cookies and leave a card.

LOVE, AVALEI

Dear Santa,
I would like a banjo and a truck 

and a race track. Thank you!
LOVE, GRAYSON

Dear Santa,
I would like an LOL doll and a 

Barbie. I also want a new sticker 
book and a snowglobe. I also 
would like PlayDoh.

LOVE, KAYLEE

Dear Santa,
I really want a toy elf, a Gabby 

dollhouse and furniture, some 
crayons, some toy food, and can-
dy.

LOVE, BREIGHLYNN

Dear Santa,
Merry Christmas! I want a 

golden PlayStation with a farm-
ing game, hunting game, and 
Fortnite.

LOVE, KNOX

Dear Santa,
My name is Blakely and I am 

5 years old. I have tried my very 
best to be so good this year, so 
I hope I am on the nice list! For 
Christmas this year, I would love 
to have a toy unicorn that moves, 
and some more things. Here is 
my Christmas wish list: a scooter, 
a princess wand and costume/
outfit, a tiara, pink and purple 
magnetic blocks, pink slime, little 
live pets, a pretend kitchen, play-
doh, makeup and lots of pretty 
jewelry, princess Barbie dolls, a 
sandbox and sand bucket toys, 
puppets, a new trampoline since 
the storm ruined ours at home, 
an art drawing kit, and a cot-
ton candymachine. I know you 
have lots of girls and boys to get 
presents for, so I can’t have ev-
erything on my list, but I am hop-

ing to get some of these things! 
Also, Santa, can you please make 
sure to get good presents for my 
big brother Attikus, and my little 
brother and sister, JJ and Tiffany 
too?They have all worked hard 
to be on the nice list too, just like 
me! My mommy is going to help 
me and my brothers make you 
some yummy cookies and a big 
cup of milk when you come to my 
house and we will make a treat 
for the reindeer too. I love you 
Santa! Thank you already!

LOVE, BLAKELY

Dear Santa,
I think I have been a very good 

girl all year. Oh! Your elf, Elfy, is 
so stinkin’ silly. For Christmas, I 
would like a real keyboard, the 
Best Friend Boy and Girl babydoll 
set, a Switch, a Lego book, and 
some jewelry. I’d also like to get 
my ears pierced. But, most of all, 
I want my mommies to have a 
baby like they have been going 
to the doctor for - that way I can 
have a baby brother or sister. Be 
safe Santa and I look forward to 
your visit!

LOVE, JOSI

Dear Santa,
I would like to have a PS5, a 

galaxy monster truck, and a real 
red and camo pistol. Can you 
bring my sister a Barbie and my 
brother a real pistol like mine?

LOVE, BROOKS

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like 

some lip gloss and lipstick, a gi-
ant pink fluffy bear, a singing and 
walking toy cat, and some toy 
food to feed my kitty.

LOVE, LILY

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I want slime 

and gel blasters. I would also like 
some cologne.

LOVE, MAVERICK

Dear Santa,
My name is Waylon Rhett and 

for Christmas I would like a new 
dirt bike, some building stuff, lots 
of monster trucks, and for my big 
gift I want a dirt track car just 
like Cory Hedgecock. His is red, 
orange, and black. I really would 
like a new tablet and some Hot 
Wheel cars.

LOVE, WAYLON

Dear Santa,
I would like an elf toy and my 

own Switch. I love Christmas. I 
hope my elves come back next 
year.

LOVE, KAYTO

Dear Santa,
I would like a Mobile Pit Stop 

Team Vehicle like the one from 
Paw Patrol.

LOVE, RYAN

Dear Santa,
I would like an Alabama 

keychain for my backpack, LOL 
dolls, a snowman toy, and a Ru-
dolph toy.

LOVE, EMMY

WOODLAND PARK 
ELEMENTARY

KINDERGARTEN
MILYNDA FARLEY

Dear Santa, 
I would like a short-sleeved 

pajama set, candy canes, and a 
purple fan for Christmas.

LOVE KERIA

Dear Santa,
I want a ride with you and your 

reindeer. I also would like a play-
dog for Christmas and would like 
my brother Cody to have a dino. 
Make sure to eat your cookies we 
will have out and drink your milk. 
Make sure to get lots of rest and 
feed the reindeer good. Make 
sure to give everyone presents, 
even the bad kids. Be safe flying 
around. I can’t wait for Christmas!

LOVE, SKYLAR

Dear Santa,
I want a bear, a big unicorn, 

a monster truck waiting outside, 
a zombie monster truck. All the 
outfits in the world. My life stuff, 
An elf on the shelf that has wings 
and flies, ice cream maker and a 
slushie maker. I’ve been working 
hard and been a good girl. 

LOVE, MADDI

Dear Santa,
This year for Christmas I want 

a weight bench and a dirt bike.
LOVE LUCAS

Dear Santa,
I want some lip balm, an um-

brella, a bracelet-making set, and 
a unicorn set. I was a good girl, or 
I tried to be. Please get my broth-
ers and sister what they want for 
Christmas. Thank you Santa.

LOVE, KAYLYNN

Dear Santa,
I Grace would like for Christ-

mas is a barbie doll and some 
skates, a bike, a doll and tea.

LOVE, GRACE

Dear Santa, It’s Lincoln Ber-
nard for Christmas I would like a 
drone so I can do cool spy stuff 
and maybe a train set. I would 
like a new scooter and some cool 
lego stuff and pokemon stuff tool

LOVE LINCOLN

Dear Santa,
I want a pixel fairy and I want 

a giant robot. I want LOL surprise 
dolls. I want a giant show ball. 

LOVE, JOSIE

Dear Santa,
I want you to come to Christ-

mas and give all of the kids gifts. 
I wish you were here to meet me. 
I would say “Hi” and give you hot 
cocoa. I hope you bring me a col-
oring book and a gabby doll.

LOVE, LILLY

Dear Santa,
How are your reindeer doing? 

Are you having a good day? I’ve 
been good this year and would 
really like a Lego Iron Man, Lego 
Batman, and some Christmas 
legos. Oh and some fornite legos.

Please bring my brothers Da-
mion and Hunter the things they 
have asked for. My family will put 
out reindeer food in the front 
yard. Also please bring my cousin 
Jackson a Santa outfit to wear.

Also bring one to both my 
brothers and to me as well. Bring 
my cousins Serinity and Kyna, 
and Xander whatever they ask 
for. Can you also bring our pet 
bird Polly some toys and seeds. 
Bring my mom and dad a lego 
lambo.

LOVE, KOLTON

Dear Santa,
I think I have been a good girl 

this year. Please bring me a new 
Barbie doll, and a Ken doll. 

Thank you!
LOVE, REMI 

Dear Santa,
I think I have been a good boy 

this year. Please bring me a pink 
switch and some toys. Could you 
bring my brother something too 
even if he’s been a bad boy.

LOVE, REMY

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a PS5. This 

can be for my brother too. I would 
also like a new bike because my 
old bike broke. I would like a new 
tablet too. 

LOVE, TANNER

Dear Santa,
Please bring me a PS5 for me 

and my brother. I would like a ro-
bot, a sticker book with stickers, 
and that is all.

LOVE, AXZAVIER

Dear Santa
Please bring me an Elsa Doll 

with make up, a barbie with a blue 
skirt and a hair brush. 

LOVE, FAITH

Dear Santa,
I would like a motorbike. I 

would also like an airplane toy. 
Please bring my mom a dinosaur 
toy so she can give it to me. I 
would also like a shark toy. 

Thank you and I love you!
LOVE, BRAYDENN

WOODLAND PARK 
ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE
AMY KELLY

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old and I have 

been good this year.  I would like 
stuffies for

Christmas!
LOVE, KEEGAN

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been funny this year.  I would 
love for you to help my mom this 

Christmas.
LOVE, HARPER

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been good.  I really want a slingy 
toy this year!

LOVE, LUKAS

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been nice this year.  I would like 
make-up, fake nails, you, and Je-
sus for Christmas.  I love you!

LOVE, TAYLEE

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old.  I have been 

good and silly this year.  I would 
like an autobot badge so I can 
become an autobot.  My sister is 
a bad guy.

LOVE, KORBIN

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been nice.  I would like a 4-wheel-
er for Christmas!

LOVE, LIZZIE

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old.  I have been 

good and silly.  I want an Ipad, 
earrings, clothes for my dolls, 
teaching stuff, and craft stuff!

LOVE, MYLEE

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been nice this year.  I really want 
a calculator for Christmas!

LOVE, LUKE

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old and I have 

been good.  I want a swat team 
box, Thunder Roaris, and a con-
struction site for Christmas.

LOVE, KASHTON

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been crazy this year.  I want a 
remote control car, a bunch of 
candy canes, and a toy elf.

LOVE, JONAH

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old.  I have been 

good and silly this year.  I want 
a dirt bike because they are fun.

LOVE, BOLTON

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been good.  I want a toy car, a 
stress ball, a Tells toy from Sonic, 
a tiny Christmas toy, a balloon, 
and blue slime.

LOVE, JAMIE

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old and I have 

been nice.  I want a toy lizard that 
sticks to anything.

LOVE, DUBHLAINN

Dear Santa,
I am 6 years old and I have 

been good this year.  I want in-
visible, glow-in-the-dark slime, a 
scooter, and a toy reindeer.  I will 
help my mom and dad too.

Love, Annistyn

Dear Santa,
I am 7 years old and I have 

been good.  I want a remote con-
trol car and boxing gloves.

LOVE, BECKETT

WOODLAND PARK
 ELEMENTARY
FIRST GRADE
BAILEY NASH

Dear Santa,
My name is Gracie. This Christ-

mas, I am 7 years old. This year, 
I have been good. What I would 
love most for Christmas is a horse.

LOVE, GRACELAND PORTER

Dear Santa,
My name is Bella. This Christ-

mas, I am 6 years old. This year, 
I have been good. What I would 
love most for Christmas is a real 
elf on the shelf.

LOVE, BELLA RAINS

Dear Santa,
My name is Makaylan. This 

Christmas, I am 7 years old. This 
year, I have been nice. What I 
would love most for Christmas is 
beach bags, jewelry, and Uggs.

LOVE, MAKAYLAN ESPIRITU

Dear Santa,
My name is Jayse. This Christ-

mas, I am 6 years old. This year, 
I have been good. What I would 
love most for Christmas is a VR 
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headset and V bucks.

LOVE, JAYSE BLAYLOCK

Dear Santa,
My name is Silas. This Christ-

mas, I am 6 and a half years old. 
This year, I have been good. What 
I would love most for Christmas 
is a robot to clean my room, to 
stay up all night, xbox, nintendo, 
roblox, and toys.

LOVE, SILAS WILSON

Dear Santa,
My name is Jackson. This 

Christmas, I am 7 years old. This 
year, I have been nice. What I 
would love most for Christmas 
is my family and a remote con-
trolled car.

LOVE, JACKSON FARLEY

Dear Santa,
My name is Cash. This Christ-

mas, I am 7 years old. This year, 
I have been good. What I would 
love most for Christmas is COWS! 
COWS! COWS! COWS!

LOVE, CASH KNOX

Dear Santa,
My name is Tucker. This Christ-

mas, I am 7 years old. This year, 
I have been good. What I would 
love most for Christmas is a 
stuffed bat and tiger stuff.

LOVE, TUCKER REECE

Dear Santa,
My name is Keydon. This 

Christmas, I am 7 years old. This 
year, I have been good. What I 
would love most for Christmas 
is a remote control car that you 
can sit in.

LOVE, KEYDON BROCK

Dear Santa,
My name is Kash. This Christ-

mas, I am 7 years old. This year, I 
have been nice. What I would love 
most for Christmas is Fortnite.

LOVE, KASH HYDER

Dear Santa,
My name is Charli. This Christ-

mas, I am 6 years old. This year, I 
have been nice. What I would love 
most for Christmas is an iPad.

LOVE, CHARLI COTTER

Dear Santa,
My name is Jayla. This Christ-

mas, I am 6 years old. This year, 
I have been nice. What I would 
love most for Christmas is a toy 
horse, mystery toy, and a color 
reveal Barbie.

LOVE, JAYLA SMITH

Dear Santa,
My name is Beth. This Christ-

mas, I am 6 years old. This year, I 
have been nice. What I would love 
most for Christmas is a horse.

Love, Beth Williams

WOODLAND PARK
FIRST GRADE 

JAMIE HASTON

Dear Santa, 
My name is Maverick Bratcher. 

This Christmas, I am 7 years old. 
This year, I have been nice. What 
I would love most for Christmas 
is a stuffed bear, toy cars, and a 
Christmas tree. 

LOVE, MAVERICK

Dear Santa, 
My name is Kyrinn Jagnandan. 

This Christmas, I am 6 years old. 
This year, I have been nice. What 
I would love most for Christmas 
is a wolverine costume, spider 
costume, a PS4 cod and a mini 
drone.           	

LOVE, KYRINN

Dear Santa, 
My name is Lauralee Baron. 

This Christmas, I am 6 years old. 
This year, I have been nice. What 
I would love most for Christmas is 
a barbie doll house, plushy, mon-
ster truck, and a robot.

LOVE, LAURALEE

Dear Santa, 
My name is Hazel Maynard. 

This Christmas, I am 7 years old. 
This year, I have been nice. What 
I would love most for Christmas 
is a squishmellow, books, stitch, 
and jewelry.

LOVE, HAZEL

Dear Santa, 
My name is Lukas Smith. This 

Christmas, I am 8 years old. This 
year, I have been nice. What I 
would love most for Christmas is 
a four wheeler, headphones, lap 
top, and a remote control truck.. 

LOVE, LUKAS

Dear Santa, 
My name is Tanner Elam. This 

Christmas, I am 7 years old. This 
year, I have been nice. What I 
would love most for Christmas is 
a lego set, tablet, cars, and trucks.

 LOVE, TANNER

Dear Santa, 
My name is Ava Tucker. This 

Christmas, I am 6 years old. This 
year, I have been nice. What I 
would love most for Christmas is 
a unicorn lego set, kinetic sand, 
lego kit, and dress up clothes. 

LOVE, AVA

Dear Santa, 
My name is Dorothy Rob-

insom. This Christmas, I am 7 
years old. This year, I have been 
nice. What I would love most for 
Christmas is a tablet, monster 
truck, and a bluey house.

LOVE, DOROTHY

Dear Santa, 
My name is Langley Seibers. 

This Christmas, I am 6 years old. 
This year, I have been nice. What 
I would love most for Christmas 
is a kitten, barbie dream house, 
bike, and a coloring book.

LOVE,  LANGLEY

Dear Santa, 
My name is Olivia Vandagriff. 

This Christmas, I am 7 years old. 
This year, I have been nice. What 
I would love most for Christmas 
is a golden tablet, hatchimals,  
squish mellow, and a new bible.

LOVE,  OLIVIA

SECOND GRADE
(SCHOOL UNKNOWN)

SYDNEY CLAYTON

Dear Santa,
Is the Nothe Poll cold? I want 

Tennessee orange stuff for Christ-
mas. How are you doing? I want a 
playhouse.

Love,
   	 NOVA CATES

 
Dear Santa,
What is your house like in the 

winter? I want a boy baby doll. 
Where is Mrs. Clals when you 
are delivering presents? I want a 
peckachoo stuffed animal.
   	 LOVE, CAROLINE GRIZZARD

 
Dear Santa,
   	 I want a Dream Drible 

or I want evoelution basketball. 
What is the North Pole like? Is it 
nice?
   	 LOVE, GRADY QUALLS

 
Dear Santa,
   	 How are you? I want 

to be homeschooled. I bet Mrs. 
Claws makes some good hot 
chochlet. I also want a evo willson 
basketball, a VR headset, a bob-
cat, and a Jesser Mini Hoop.
   	 LOVE, HAYDEN STOGLIN

 
Dear Santa,
   	 How are you? Is the Norf 

Pole a lot of snow? I haf been 
good. I love my elf. She has been 
good. I want a toy for Christmas.
   	 LOVE, CHLOE MASON

 
Dear Santa,
What’s the Norf Pole like this 

year? Is the Norf Pole cold? I have 
been so so good this year. For 
Christmas, I want slime.
   	 LOVE, GRACE STEWART

 
Dear Santa,
Santa, how are you and your 

randeer? I want a big bobcat for 
Christmas. I wonder how is Ru-
dolf and my elf? I want a punchee 
bag, just the bag. I also want to 
be homeschooled.
   	 LOVE, WYATT CLARK

 
Dear Santa,
How are you? Is it cold in the 

North Pole? Where did the bells 
come from? Do you go anywhere? 

I want to meet you. Where did the 
raindeers come from?
   	 LOVE, ALEXIS RICE

 
 Dear Santa,
How are you? How is the 

North Pole this year? This year I 
have been so so good. I want a 
pool for Christmas.
   	 LOVE, AMELIA PRATER

 
Dear Santa,
How are you? How do you buy 

toys? How are you so far away? I 
love you Santa! I want bees.
   	 LOVE, WILLOW BILBREY

 
Dear Santa,
   	 I’m wondering what do 

your deer eat? I have been great 
this year. Can I have an elf on the 
shelf? Also books to read and 
color. I want butterfly earrings.
   	 LOVE, ARIANNA BELTZ

 
Dear Santa,
Do the elfs go through Alaska? 

What is your favorite part of the 
workshop? I want a giant cookie 
and stuff for my hamster.
   	 LOVE, ABIGAIL YOUNG

Dear Santa,
Can I have some craons? I 

want a coloring book. Can I have 
a book? I want some paint.
   	 LOVE, MICHAELA BRADLEY

 
Dear Santa,
How are you? I love when you 

come to my house. I have bin 
good this year. Now I will tell you 
what I want. I want a pair of Uggs 
and something from Ulta. Sum-
mer Fridays from Ulta and tart 
conseler.
   	 LOVE, MCKINLEE STOUT

 
Dear Santa,
All I want for Christmas is a 

robot kitty. Santa, is the Noth Poll 
cold there? I been good this year.
   	 LOVE, RAYLEIGH JONES

 
Dear Santa,
   	 What is it like at the 

North Pole? I have ben great this 
year. I want a girl elf, hello kitty 
stuff, a baby elf, two baby elfs, 

and more nintindo games.
   	 LOVE, OLIVIA PIPPIN

 
Dear Santa,
I want a switch and switch 

games. I want a goldfish with a 
tank. How is the weather? I want 
to be homeschooled.
   	 LOVE, EVAN HOGG

Dear Santa,
I wish for a sonic plushie, a 

Tails plushie, and a VR headset. 
I hope you have the best Christ-
mas ever.

	 LOVE, RIJ WHITSON

KINDERGARTEN
JACKIE ATKINSON

Dear Santa,
You are the best!  I want a 

monster truck, racecar, Hot-
wheels, and a punching bag.  
Bring my brother a PS4.  We are 
making cookies for you.

SINCERELY, NASH COOK

Dear Santa,
I want a police car, skateboard, 

fretruck, and an ambulance.  I 
want a helicopter army set.  
Thanks for bringing me presents.  
I will leave you some cookies and 
milk.

SINCERELY, ELIJAH FOX

Dear Santa,
I want a Nintendo Switch, a 

glue pen, and a hat that can glow 
in the dark. I love you Santa.  I 
will make some reindeer food for 
your reindeer.  You are the best!

SINCERELY, KIMBER HUFF

Dear Santa,
I want a Barbie Limo playset, 

a Barbie jeep and an American 
Girl doll. Thank you for giving me 
presents.  I will leave you some 
cookies and milk and some car-
rots for your reindeer.  I love you! 

SINCERELY, CALI JOHNSON

Dear Santa,
I want a police car and a Fer-

rari remote control car.  I want a 
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Simplex Horn Strobe and a Sim-
plex Pull Station.

SINCERELY, CARSON MARSHALL

Dear Santa,
I would like a chupacabra 

keychain, a toy dinosaur and I 
would like for my brother Chriss 
to have a bigfoot keychain for his 
backpack.  For Gabby, a purse for 
her things and for Adella, a dino-
saur stuffie.  She likes dinosaurs 
like me.  Dad needs a fishing rod 
and mom needs a new hair dryer.  
Thank you!

SINCERELY, BRYLEE NASH

Dear Santa,
I want for Christmas 2 Barbie 

Dolls and a unicorn stuffie and a 
little cow stuffie.  One more thing, 
I want a Barbie Doll like the one 
from the movie.  I’ll leave you a 
thank you card!

SINCERELY, TEEGAN PHILLIPS

Dear Santa,
I would like a little notebook 

and some squishies for me and 
my sisters.  I also want some 

Barbies.  We will leave you some 
chocolate chip cookies.

SINCERELY, THEA RANDOLPH

Dear Santa,
Thank you for giving me pres-

ents.  I would like a Spiderman 
toy, an Ironman toy and a Sonic 
toy.  I will leave you some cookies 
and milk from the fridge.

SINCERELY, JOSEPH SAGASTUME

Dear Santa,
I want an Ironman costume. 

One Ironman that is gray and 

black, and a good Ironman that is 
a toy. That’s all I want.  My sister 
really likes dolls so bring her like 4 
dolls.  I would like my mom to get 
6 rings and my dad a new shirt 
and 1 pair of boots that are new 
and 1 pair of new gloves.

That’s what I want for me and 
my family.  Thank you Santa!

SINCERELY, JACKSON TAGGART

Dear Santa,
I hope everybody gets pres-

ents.  Your elves are working very 
hard.  I want a WWE ring and 
WWE wrestlers.  I want Monster 
Truck Jam, a skateboard set up, 
and a skateboard.  I will leave you 
some cookies and milk.  I have 
been good.

SINCERELY, TY WILSON

Dear Santa,
Happy Christmas!  I love you!  I 

would like a Barbie Dreamhouse.  
They are the best.  You are the 
best Santa.  Please bring my mom 
a coffee machine and for my 
dad a red t-shirt with buttons.  I 
will leave out some cookies, car-
rots and milk for you and your 
reindeer.  I’ll watch for your foot-
prints.

SINCERELY, HARPER WINNETT

Dear Santa,
My mom and dad are taking 

me to Mamaws.  I am excited!  I 
would like a watch and a basket-
ball for Christmas. Thank you for 
giving me presents.  I love you!

SINCERELY, ELIZABETH YOUNG

LACEY CLARK’S CLASS
(SCHOOL UNKOWN)

Dear Santa,
My name is Samar Patel. I am 

5 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love Sonic pillow, 
hoodies, and a tesla car.

LOVE, SAMAR PATEL

Dear Santa,
My name is Kyson Oliver. I am 

5 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a play kitchen 
with a house, a belt, and play-
dough.

LOVE, KYSON OLIVER

Dear Santa,
My name is Parker Elam. I am 

6 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love barbie clothes, 
playdough, and bath bombs.

LOVE, PARKER ELAM

Dear Santa,
My name is Collin Will. I am 6 

years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love Lego cars, hot 
wheels track, and minion fart gun.

LOVE, COLLIN WILL

Dear Santa,
My name is Raiden Kaulay. I 

am 6 years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love Aircraft 
carrier, Roblox gift card, and a 
magnetic Picassotile people.

LOVE, RAIDEN KAULAY

Dear Santa,
My name is Chloe Atnip. I am 

5 years old. This year I have been 
very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love a big mickey, 
elf on the shelf, and toy claw 
machine.

LOVE, CHLOE ATNIP

Dear Santa,
My name is Edward Chea. I 

am 5 years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love Miss Clark, 
I love mine, and a craft mummy.

LOVE, EDWARD CHEA

Dear Santa,
My name is AnnaBella Bak-

er-Seal. I am 5 years old. This 
year I have been very good. For 
Christmas this year, I would love 
pretty nails, make- up, and a big 
trampoline.

LOVE, ANNABELLA BAKER-SEAL

Dear Santa,
My name is Genesis Taylor. I 

am 6 years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love make-up, a 
purple jeep, and slime.

LOVE, GENESIS TAYLOR

Dear Santa,
My name is Aiden Larry. I am 

5 years old. This year I have been 

very good. For Christmas this 
year, I would love boots, a bear, 
and a tablet.

LOVE, AIDEN LARRY

Dear Santa,
My name is Reese Heady. I 

am 6 years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love nike slides, 
a minion fart gun, and a Gatorade 
bottle.

LOVE, REESE HEADY

Dear Santa,
My name is IvyRose Mosher. I 

am 6 years old. This year I have 
been very good. For Christmas 
this year, I would love a mermaid 
doll, a puppy that acts real, and 
a frozen car electric and pink 
motercycle.

LOVE, IVYROSE MOSHER

AMYROSE LARDNER’S CLASS
(SCHOOL UNKNOWN)

GRACIE DOLIN: 
I would like for everyone to 

have a good Christmas! I would 
like Silvia, my elf, to stay, a skate-
board, my brother to calm down, 
and a doll house. Last but not 
least, thank you!

BOONE WHITMAN:
 For Christmas I would like a 

bearded dragon. My mom says 
they’re too big, but don’t you 
have a meeting with my parents? 
That’s what they say! I would like 
for it to snow on my  birthday so 
I won’t have to come to school! 
I would also like for you to send 
another elf, so Buster, my elf, will 
have a friend. Thank you!

SILAS SIMMONS:  
I would like a baby brother and 

a trip to Hawaii. I would also like 
a Youtube Channel. Please let my 
friends have a great Christmas. 
Thank you for what you have 
done!

EVIE LAWSON: 
I would like to get a big Teddy 

Bear. I don’t want the Grinch 
to steal Christmas again. Please 
don’t let that happen!

COLT HATCHER:
I would like to get a hunting 

camera, food for the deer, a pic-
ture of my grandpa, LED lights, 
a mini fridge, a portable charger, 
and a poster of both of my grand-
pas. Thank you Santa! 

TORI LOFTIS:
I would like a real cat that is 

nice, a stuffed bunny and cat. 
Please may i have a Barbie Doll 
and a Stitch chair! Thank you 
Santa!

ZAYLEE AGUERO:
What I want for Christmas is 

skates, dirt bike, a four wheeler, 
phone, computer and a knife. I 

With a wave, a wink, a smile and hello,
just dropping a note to make sure you know:

We really appreciate good folks like you
for all that you’ve done to help us through.
As we wrap up this year, come what may,

we’re glad to be here every step of the way.
For it’s neighbors like you and the good that you do

that fill us with hope and with gratitude too.

May this holiday season
deliver everything you’ve been

hoping for and more!

CitizensBankSpartaTN.com

577 West Bockman Way 
Sparta, TN   836-2265

325 North Spring
 Sparta, TN   836-1050 MEMBER 

F.D.I.C.

TWO CONVENIENT
LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU

Sales: (931) 836-3157 • Toll Free: (888) 332-7034
674 West Bockman Way, Sparta 

EDD ROGERSEDD ROGERS
CHEVROLET

EddRogersChevy.net

Putting You First...Keeps Us First.

With Our Gratitude,
MERRY CHRISTMAS!
To our valued customers and friends at Christmastime, best wishes for a happy 
and healthy holiday season. We hope it’s decked out with every happiness your 
heart can hold!

EDD ROGERS
ALLEY FORD

Hwy. 111 South, Sparta • 931-738-2311
1-800-332-7034 • EddRogersValleyFord.com

Thanks for Making Our 

Whole Year Brighter.

Thanks for sticking with us this year, and for making this 
community such a wonderful place to be at Christmastime.

Merry Christmas from
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would like to wish you a Merry 
CHristmas Santa. Thank you for 
coming to us! I love you Santa. 

JACKSON HERRON: 
	I would like some coal to play  

with along with a dart board. 
Please fill my stocking with can-
dy. I almost forgot, that you so 
much for everything else you 
worked hard on. P.S. JJ my elf 
needs a new hat if you can find 
one for him!

HAZEL SPARKMAN:
	Thank you for the gifts that 

you gave me in the past. I would 
like roller skates, a stitch plush 
chair, baby boy clothes for my 
new baby  brother, maybe a cat 

if you can. If not, thanks okay, but 
I really hope you can bring one. 
That’s all. Thank you for my elf.

AXEL TURNER: 
	I would like an XBox con-

troller, a basketball, v bucks, a 
t.v. crocs charms, mini fridge, 
a phone, and basketball crocs. 
Thank you for all the stuff you 
have given me. I love you!

RHEALEE KING
	All I want for Christmas is pjs, 

a mini fridge, blanket and a chair. 
Thank you for all your hard work. 
Have a holly jolly Christmas.

RHIANNON PEEK:
	I would like a box of slime

JOSEPH DILLON:
	I would like a PS5, xbox, and 

some nerf stuff. Thank you for 
doing your best during Christ-
mas. 

BRAEDON EVANS:
	Can you please get me a 

cat, ps5, football,phone, and ro-
bucks? Thank you for sending me 
and my sister an early Christmas 
gift!  

ELLIP SCHALK:
	Thank you Santa for the gifts 

that you have given to me over 
the years! This year I would like an 
iPhone 16 and a nintendo switch. 
Thank you and Merry Christmas 

Santa!

SKYLER SMITH:
 I would like a dirt bike, sonic 

toys and 70 billion dollars. Please 
and thank you!

INDIVIDUAL LETTERS
Dear Santa,
My name is Casson Stewart 

Clark from Pittsboro, North Caro-
lina. I am 5 years old. I am visit-
ing my grandparents in Sparta. 
I have tried to be good this year 
but sometimes it is hard. Please 
forgive me for cutting my little 
sister’s hair.  For Christmas, I 
would like some farm equipment 
to play with. Please bring my little 

sister Anna Ruth a stuffed animal 
and my big sister Ella some ballet 
slippers and makeup.  I will leave 
you some cookies and milk on 
Christmas Eve.  Thank you Santa. 

YOUR GOOD FRIEND, CASSON

Dear Santa, 
I have tried to be good so 

hard. I think I’m a good kid . I am
a good kid my mom has. For 

Christmas I want monster high 
Barbie dolls. I love Monster High 
the brats doll cartoon. And I want 
a hello kitty rug for my new room 
in my new house. I hope you get 
my letter and believe me when I 
say I have been good. I am five 
years old. Merry Christmas

FROM JORDYN MARIE

Dear Santa,
My name is Khilee Cunning-

ham and I am 9 years old and in 
3rd grade at  Woodland Park El-
ementary. I have been very good 
this year. Plz bring me a gabby 
doll house, some Moana toys, 
and meta quest 3, plz dont for-
get my Daddy he has been good 
bring him something nice. Dont 
forget my Nana she has been 
very good. Plz bring my 5 cousins 
Gabby, Jake, Graci, Landon, Jaxx 
something good. I will leave you 
cookies and milk.

 LOVE ALWAYS, KHILEE CUNNINGHAM        

DOYLE ELEMENTARY. Kindergarten - Abbie Usrey’s class JORDYN MARIE LEFTWICH
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JACKIE ATKINSON’S CLASS. Kindergarten KHILEE CUNNINGHAM 
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